Fire Prevention Systems Services

Bid #17-1109FP Bid Tabulation

Pillar Fire Protection
Section 1 ARK Systems | Innovations Products
Fire Sprinkler Systems, Fire Pumps, Back Flow Preventers,
Fire Alarms and Hood Suppression Systems
Location 1 Garrett County Health Center
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $946.21 $1,850.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $680.00 $800.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Location 2 Garrett County Community Action Center
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $753.33 $1,150.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $265.00 $350.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Hood Suppression No Bid $350.00 $90.00
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $72.00 $30.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $85.00 $40.00
Location 3 Garrett County Courthouse
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $753.33 $1,100.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $639.00 $725.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Hood Suppression No Bid $350.00 $90.00
Repair per hour (8 A M. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $72.00 $30.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $101.00 $40.00
Location 4 Garrett County Vistiors Center
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $240.00 $300.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 PM., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Location 5 Solid Waste and Recycling Division
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $240.00 $350.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 PM., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
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Location 6 Kitzmiller School

Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $235.00 $300.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Location 7 Adventure Sports Center International

Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $860.00 $1,100.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $160.00 $200.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A\M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Location 8 Garrett County Oakland Road Garage

Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $343.96 $450.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 $72.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 $101.00 No Bid
Discount for parts is % discount from list 30% 20%
is % markup from cost 25% 30%
Section 2 - Monitoring

Remote Monitoring Garrett County Health Center

Quarterly Monitoring Rate $60.00 $60.00 No Bid
Remote Monitoring Adventure Sports Center International

Quarterly Monitoring Rate $60.00 $60.00 No Bid
Remote Monitoring Kitzmiller School

Quarterly Monitoring Rate $60.00 $60.00 No Bid
Section 3 - Fire Extingisher Inspection and Services
A.21/21b. ABC No Bid No Bid $37.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $7.75
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $7.75
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
B.51b. ABC No Bid No Bid $46.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $11.25
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $7.75
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
C. 101b. ABC No Bid No Bid $76.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $18.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $7.75
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
D. 20 1b. ABC No Bid No Bid $158.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
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Recharge No Bid No Bid $25.25
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $7.75
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
E.2 1/21b. CO2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.51b. CO2 No Bid No Bid $127.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $14.50
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $14.00
G. 101b. CO2 No Bid No Bid $186.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $17.50
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $14.00
H. 15 1b. CO2 No Bid No Bid $215.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $20.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $14.00
1. 20 1b. CO2 No Bid No Bid $262.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $24.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $14.00
J. 30 Ib. CO2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recharge No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid No Bid
K. 2 1/2 Ib. HALON No Bid No Bid $153.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid *$62.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $22.00
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
L. 51b. HALON No Bid No Bid $210.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid *$114.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $32.00
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
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M. 9 1b. HALON No Bid No Bid $375.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid *$196.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $48.00
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
N. 10 Ib. HALON No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid *$217.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $52.00
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
O.11b. BC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid No Bid
P.51bBC No Bid No Bid $44.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $11.05
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $7.75
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
Q. 101b. BC No Bid No Bid $74.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $17.90
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $7.75
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
R. 201b. BC No Bid No Bid $115.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $25.10
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $7.75
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
S.251b CG No Bid No Bid $109.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid *$90.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $21.25
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
T.51b CG No Bid No Bid $164.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid *$181.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $32.00
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
U.91b CG No Bid No Bid $333.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid *$319.00
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6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid $48.00
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
V.251b CG No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid No Bid
W. 9 1b K-Guard No Bid No Bid $138.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $72.50
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $9.25
X.1251b PK No Bid No Bid $1,975.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $40.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid *$400.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $367.00
Y. 110 1b NIT No Bid No Bid $820.00
Maintenance No Bid No Bid $3.00
Recharge No Bid No Bid $14.50
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid $27.00
Replacement Parts:
A. Gauge No Bid No Bid $6.00
B. Valve Stem No Bid No Bid $6.00
C."O" Ring No Bid No Bid $1.65
D. Nozzle No Bid No Bid $5.25
E. Hose Assembly No Bid No Bid $5.50
F. Siphon Tube No Bid No Bid $5.50
G. Wall Hanger No Bid No Bid $2.50
H. Vehicle Bracket No Bid No Bid $18.00
I. Collar Rings No Bid No Bid $1.00
J. Pull Pins No Bid No Bid $0.75
K. Cartridges No Bid No Bid List Price less 20%
L. Installation No Bid No Bid $0.50
M. Condemned No Bid No Bid $1.00
N. Fire Extinguisher Cover - Small No Bid No Bid $14.00
O. Fire Extinguisher Cover - Medium No Bid No Bid $15.00
P. Fire Extinguisher Cover - Large No Bid No Bid $16.00
Q. Weatherproof Tag No Bid No Bid $1.00
Minimum Stop Fee No Bid No Bid **$25.00

Notes: Fire Protection Products - * Section 3- Recharge K,L,M,N,S,T,U & X includes chemical.
**Minimum Stop Fee - $25.00 (if service does not total this amount).






