Garrett County Health Center Exterior Lighting Retrofit Project
Bid #20-0625 Bid Tabulation

Beitzel Corporation Evergreen Electric, LLC Cadecor Energy and Lighting American Energy Services, LLC S+ Electric, Inc. Zerodraft Maryland, LLC
Item # | Description Quantity | M; acturer/Part # Unit Cost Total Manufacturer/Part # | Unit Cost Total Manufacturer/Part# Unit Cost Total A Part # Unit Cost Total A /Part # Unit Cost Total Manufacs /Part # Unit Cost Total
Exterior Lighting * Minimum
Best LEDMPALPROSO Sloan LCA-SB-60W-U-
18,000 Lumens */5K 69 5K $265.45 $18,316.05 | EcoMax SBSOWAIXYZ| $278.00 $19,182.00 Best LEDPro80 $325.00 | $22,425.00 50K-T3-BZD1 $415.12 $28,643.28 |LEDMPALPROSO-5K-T3  $425.00 $29,325.00 | Altech AE-LALHSM-60) $529.24 $36,517.56
Less Potomac Edison Rebate $10,350.00 $8,070.00 $10,350.00 $10,350.00 $10,350.00 $10,350.00
Exterior Lighting Total $7,966.05 $11,112.00 $12,075.00 $18,293.28 $18,975.00 $26,167.56
Light Poles
Shakespeare SS4A-14.5
2A | 14.5 Composite Light Poles 49 Whatley SS415AB DB2 | $712.64 $34,919.36 | CMT-ZA4-A-15BZ19/28) $906.00 $44,394.00 Valmont Composite S $810.00 $39,690.00 $872.19 $42,737.31 SS4-15-AB-DBZ $1,130.00 $55,370.00 | Whatley SS4-15-AB-DBZ| $1,317.80 $64,572.20
LyteSQ-P4-11-15-AB- Hubbell HLOL SSSH General Structures CPS- PS4-11-15DZ/Bolt
2B [14.5 Metal Light Poles 49 RAB PS4 11 1502 $668.10 | $32,736.90 D1/D2-DB $764.00 | $37.436.00 | 1540ASIDBTLAB | $621.00 | $30,429.00 | 140111SABDLDB | $967.51 | $47,407.99 4/11/BCKS4 $1,030.00 $50,470.00 RAB PS4-11-15DZ $1,230.90 $60,314.10
Lyte-10540-12-15-Arm-
2C_|14.5 Aluminum Light Poles 49 |Valmont S1500 40404Y4{ $635.35 | $31,132.15 DI/D2DB $925.00 | $45,325.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 S15004004Y4-XX-DDB|  $1,090.00 $53,410.00 $1,182.50 $57,942.50
Bid Summary - Composite Light Poles
Best LEDMPALPROSO Sloan LCA-SB-60W-U-
Exterior Lightin, 5K $7,966.05 EcoMax SB-8OWA1XYZ| $11,112.00 Best LEDPro80 $12,075.00 50KT3-BZD1 $18,293.28 LEDMPALPROS0-5K-T3| $18.975.00 Altech AELALHS-M-60) $26,167.56
Shakespeare SS4A-14.5
Light Poles Whatley SS415AB DB2 $34.919.36 CMT-ZA4-A-15BZ19/2¢| $44,394.00 Valmont Composite S $39,690.00 BZ19 $42,737.31 SS4-15-AB-DBZ $55,370.00 Whatley $54-15-AB-DBZ| $64,572.20
Total $42,885.41 $55,506.00 $51,765.00 $61,030.59 $74,345.00 $90,739.76
Bid Summary - Metal Light Poles
Best LEDMPALPROSO Sloan LCA-SB-60W-U-
Exterior Lighting 5K $7.966.05 EcoMax SBROWAIXYZ $11,112.00 Best LEDPro80 $12,075.00 50K-T3BZD1 $18,293.28 LEDMPALPROS0-5K-T3 $18,975.00 Altech AE-LALHSM-60 $26,167.56
LyteSQP4-11T-15-AB- Hubbell HLOL SSSH General Structures CPS PS4.T1-15DZ/Bolt
Light Poles RAB PS4 11 1502 $32,736.90 DI1/D2-DB $37,436.00 1540A-S2-DBT-LAB $30,429.00 1-4011-15-AB-D1-DB $47,407.99 4/11/BCK-S4 $50,470.00 RAB PS4-11-15DZ $60,314.10
Total $40,702.95 $48,548.00 $42,504.00 $65,701.27 $69,445.00 $86,481.66
Bid Summary - Aluminum Light Poles
Best LEDMPALPROSO
Exterior Lighting 5K $7,966.05 EcoMax SB-8OWAIXYZ $11,112.00 No Bid No Bid LEDPALPRO8S0-5K-T3 $18,975.00 Altech AELALHS-M-60) $26,167.56
Lyte-10540-12-15-Arm-
Light Poles [Valmont S-1500 40404Y4 $31,132.15 D1/D2-DB $45,325.00 No Bid No Bid $1500-4004Y4-XX-DDB $53,410.00 Lightmart 15A48S125 $57,942.50
Total $39,098.20 $56,437.00 No Bid No Bid $72,385.00 $84,110.06
84203 depending on pole
Completion Time Calendar Days from Notice of Award type selected 75 90 90 120 2




