Fuel Bid #21-0520F

Bid Tabulation

Bid Price Oakland Oil & Propane | Bruceton Petroleum Co., Mansfield Oil of
Inc. Gainesville

Cetane 42-On Road Diesel Fuel $1.8475 $1.8286 $1.8836
Markup $.0780 $.0785 $.0361
Total $1.9255 $1.9071 $1.9197
Unleaded Gasoline (Low Test) Octane 87 $1.8570 $1.8327 $1.8574
Markup $.0695 $.0710 $.0370
Total $1.9265 $1.9037 $1.8944
White Kerosene $2.1025 $2.1025 $2.7117
Markup $.0780 $.0924 $.1276
Total $2.1805 $2.1949 $2.8393
Heating Oil $1.7275 $1.7625 No Bid
Markup $.0815 $.0924 No Bid
Total $1.809 $1.8549 No Bid
Off Road Diesel Fuel $1.8525 $1.8336 No Bid
(Dyed Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel)




Markup

$.0815

$.0815

No Bid

Total

$1.934

$1.9151

No Bid
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