Motor Oil and Grease

Bid #14-0417MO Bid Tabulation

PPC Lubricants, Inc. Petro Choice Bedford Valley
Petroleum
5W-30 Motor Qil Peak Syn B1 5W30 Choice Syn Blend Coastal/Warren
Brand Name SAE 5W30
Gallon 6.12 6.20 6.25
55 Gallon Drum 364.10 374.75 377.85
Quart 2.66 (6/1) 243 2.31
10W-30 Motor Qil Peak 10W/30 GF.5 Choice Syn Blend Coastal/Warren
Brand Name SAE 10W30
Quart 2.66(6/1) 2.36 2.43
15W-40 Motor Oil Peak 15W40 CJ4 Mobil Fleet 15W40 Lubriguard
Brand Name
Gallon 6.74 6.93 7.25
55 Gallon Drum 398.20 414.90 426.75
5 Gallon Pail 39.70 42.15 44.25
Quart 2.77 (6/1) 2.89 3.06
85W-140 Gear Lubricant Peak 85W140 Conoco Universal Coastal
Brand Name Gear Lube 85W 140
Gallon 7.70 9.82 7.25
55 Gallon Drum 451.00 573.85 426.75
5 Gallon Pail 43.75 56.60 44.30
120 LB. Keg 181.44 177.62 170.40
Multipurpose Tractor Fluid Peak UTF Choice Premium Coastal
Brand Name UTF
Gallon 5.94 6.39 6.79
55 Gallon Drum 354.20 385.20 401.45
5 Gallon Pail 35.70 38.20 41.95
Quart 8.79/gal (6/1 gal case) 1.83 4.49
Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 Shell Rotella Ua T Shell Rotella T TP Shell
Heavy Duty Engine Oil 15W40 CJ4 15W40 CJ-4
Brand Name
Gallon 9.29 10.50 11.79
55 Gallon Drum 590.70 611.25 676.45
5 Gallon Pail 54.75 60.00 66.95
Quart 3.94 (12/1) 4.05 3.99
Transmission Fluid Castrol Trans C 30 | Conoco Powerdrive Coastal 30WT04
Brand Name (meets CAT T0-4 30
spec)

Gallon 10.28 8.47 8.25
55 Gallon Drum 645.15 499.60 517.01
5 Gallon Pail 58.65 49.85 49.25
Quart No Bid N/A N/A




PPC Lubricants, Inc. Petro Choice Bedford Valley
Petroleum
Multipurpose Lithium Complex | Castrol Pyroplex Red | Conoco Multiplex Coastal
Grease Brand Name #2 Red #2
Gallon No Bid N/A 15.2727
55 Gallon Drum 1020.00 (400 b 1052.00 840.00
drum)

120 LB. Keg 327.60 321.51 303.60
Tube 2.90 2.95 106.25
10W-40 Motor Oil Peak 10W/40 Cam?2 Super Pro Coastal Warren
Brand Name Max Syn 10W/40
Gallon 7.49 6.57 6.42
55 Gallon Drum 431.20 505.31 386.60
5 Gallon Pail No Bid 40.35 40.10
Quart 2.57 (6/1) 2.34 2.2716
80W-90 High Performance Gear Peak 80W90 Conoco Universal Coastal
Oil  Brand Name Gear Lube 80W/90
Gallon 9.74 9.60 6.92
55 Gallon Drum 563.20 561.75 408.60
120 LB. Keg 226.08 174.10 188.40
Tube No Bid N/A N/A
Bottle (32 oz.) 3.29 3.46 4.79 qt
Power Steering Fluid Mag 1 Power Steering Pyroil Power Pyroil
Brand Name Fluid Steering Fluid
Gallon Bottle 10.18(4/1 gal case) 2.62 32 oz N/A
Quart 2.62 1.30 2.70
5W-30 Synthetic Blend GF-5 Peak Syn B1 5W30 Choice Syn Blend Coast/Warren
Motor Oil Brand Name SAE 5W30
Gallon 6.12 6.20 6.25
55 Gallon Drum 364.10 374.75 377.85
120 LB. Keg No Bid 119.70 N/A
5 Gallon Pail 36.60 38.50 39.25
1 Gallon Pail No Bid N/A N/A
Quart 2.66 2.43 2.31

Notes: Petro Choice - Choice 5W30 qts & 10W30 qts will be labeled as Cam2. Qt case of 15W40 will
be Conoco Fleet EC 15W40. Conoco Universal Gear Lube 80W90 in 32 oz. is a per gt cost.

Bedford Valley Petroleum - Valvoline alternative products: Allfleet Gal 8.25, Drum 481.75, 5 Gal Pail
49.30. Prem Blue 15w40 Gal 10.63, Drum 612.65, 5 Gal Pail 61.15. Coastal AW46 Hydr Fluid Gal
5.49, Drum 329.95, 5 Gal Pail 35.45. Antifreeze 50/50 Pink Zerex per gallon 6.25, Green Concentrate
Antifreeze 8.25



