Contract Number 11-0602C-HD
Contract Title-Culvert Pipe
Attachment 1-Price Schedule

Galvanized Drainage Pipe-Plain
Cost Information
Size Cost per Ft. Bands Flared End
Diameter

6" Perf 5.28 No Bid
12" 64.31
15" 80.68
18" 102.27
21" 122.15
30" 278.40
72" 83.57 125.39
78" 90.51 135.76 3081.81
84" 121.64 182.44 3359.09
90" 130.28 195.39 4244.31
96" 138.92 208.37 4375.00
102" 275.56 No Bid

Polyethylene Corrugated Drainage Pipe
Cost Information
Size Type Couplings Flared End
Smooth Interior Sections
Diameter $FT

54" 131.83 No Bid No Bid




