

Contract Number-14-0417MO
Contract Title-Motor Oil & Grease
Attachment 1-Price Schedule

	PPC Lubricants
5W-30 Motor Oil	Peak Syn BI 5W30
Brand Name	
Gallon	6.12
55 Gallon Drum	364.10
Quart	2.66
10W-30 Motor Oil	Peak 10W30 GF-5
Brand Name	
Quart	2.66
15W-40 Motor Oil	Peak 15W40 CJ4
Brand Name	
Gallon	6.74
55 Gallon Drum	398.20
5 Gallon Pail	39.70
Quart	2.77
85W-140 Gear Lubricant	Peak 85W140
Brand Name	
Gallon	7.70
55 Gallon Drum	451.00
5 Gallon Pail	43.75
120 LB. Keg	181.44
Multipurpose Tractor Fluid	Peak UTF
Brand Name	
Gallon	5.94
55 Gallon Drum	354.20
5 Gallon Pail	35.70
Quart	8.79/Gal
Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 Heavy Duty Engine Oil	Shell Rotella T 15W40 CJ4
Brand Name	
Gallon	9.29
55 Gallon Drum	590.70
5 Gallon Pail	54.75
Quart	3.94
Transmission Fluid	Castrol Trans C30
Brand Name	
Gallon	10.28
55 Gallon Drum	645.15
5 Gallon Pail	58.65
Quart	No bid
Multipurpose Lithium Complex Grease	Castrol Pyroplex Red #2
Brand Name	
Gallon	No bid
55 Gallon Drum	1,020.00/400 lb. Drum
120 LB. Keg	327.60
Tube	2.90

	PPC Lubricants
10W-40 Motor Oil	Peak 10W40
Brand Name	
Gallon	7.49
55 Gallon Drum	431.20
5 Gallon Pail	No Bid
Quart	2.57
80W-90 High Performance Gear Oil	Peak 80W90
Brand Name	
Gallon	9.74
55 Gallon Drum	563.20
120 LB. Keg	226.08
Tube	No bid
Bottle (32 oz.)	3.29
Power Steering Fluid	Mag 1 Power Steering Fluid
Brand Name	
Gallon Bottle	10.18
Quart	2.62
5W-30 Synthetic Blend GF-5 Motor Oil	Peak Syn Bl 5W30
Brand Name	
Gallon	6.12
55 Gallon Drum	364.10
120 LB. Keg	No bid
5 Gallon Pail	36.60
1 Gallon Pail	No bid
Quart	2.66