Contract Number-17-0525MQO
Contract Title-Motor Oil & Grease
Attachment 1-Price Schedule

Bruceton Petroleum Co., Inc.

(BFS Foods)
10W-30 Motor Qil Brand Name Multiguard r5Formula 500 Syn. Blend
Quart 2.25
15W-40 Motor Qil Brand Name Multiguard Premium 15W40 CJ4
Gallon 5.15
55 Gallon Drum 314.60
5 Gallon Pail 34.15
Quart 2.75
85W-140 Gear Lubricant Brand Name Multiguard HD, EP GL-5 85W140
Gallon 7.10
55 Gallon Drum 408.00
5 Gallon Pail 40.14
120 LB. Keg 156.90
Multipurpose Tractor Fluid Brand Name Multiguard Premium UTH Fluid
Gallon 4.56
55 Gallon Drum 275.00
5 Gallon Pail 31.95
Quart 4.39
Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 Heavy Duty Engine Oil  Brand Name Shell Rotella T-3 15W40 CJ4
Gallon 9.98
55 Gallon Drum 654.00
5 Gallon Pail 61.95
Quart 3.95
Transmission Fluid Brand Name Multiguard Transmission Fluid TO-4
Gallon 5.59
55 Gallon Drum 329.00
5 Gallon Pail 33.95
Quart No Bid
Multipurpose Lithium Complex Grease Brand Name Valvoline Cerulean
Gallon No Bid
55 Gallon Drum No Bid
120 LB. Keg 385.00
Tube 3.19
10W-40 Motor Oil Brand Name Multiguard Prem. Syn. Blend 10W40
Gallon No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 319.00
5 Gallon Pail No Bid
Quart 2.09
80W-90 High Performance Gear QOil Brand Name Multiguard HP GL-5 80W/90
Gallon 7.29
55 Gallon Drum 429.00
120 LB. Keg 143.95
Tube No bid

Bottle (32 oz.)

9.24 gallon bottles




Power Steering Fluid Brand Name Berkebile Power Steering Fluid
Gallon Bottle No Bid

Quart 1.69

5W-30 Synthetic Blend GF-5 Motor Oil Brand Name Multiguard Prem. Syn. Blend 5W30
Gallon 4.09

55 Gallon Drum 259.00

120 LB. Keg No Bid

5 Gallon Pail No Bid

1 Gallon Pail No Bid

Quart 2.09

80W-140 Synthetic Gear Brand Name Multiguard Full Synthetic GL-5
Gallon 14.99

55 Gallon Drum 847.25

5 Gallon Pail 80.95

120 LB. Keg 264.95

CD-50 Synthetic Gear Brand Name Multiguard Syn. Trans. Fluid 50
Gallon 12.84

55 Gallon Drum 686.50

5 Gallon Pail 72.95

120 LB. Keg 234.95




