Fire Prevention Systems Services

Bid #11-1103FP Bid Tabulation

Section 1: Fire Sprinkler Systems, Fire Pumps, Back Flow Ashby Fire Protection
Preventers, Fire Alarms and Hood Suppression Systems Products ARK Systems
Location 1 Garrett County Health Center
Annual Recommended Maintenance No Bid $2,905.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $125.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $125.00
Location 2 Garrett County Community Action Center

$45.00 Kitchen Hood
Annual Recommended Maintenance Suppression System $2,704.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $25.00 $125.00
Overtime Rate $35.00 $125.00
Location 3 Garrett County Courthouse

$45.00 Kitchen Hood
Annual Recommended Maintenance Suppression System $2,906.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $25.00 $125.00
Overtime Rate $35.00 $125.00
Location 4 Garrett County Vistiors Center
Annual Recommended Maintenance No Bid $660.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $125.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $125.00
Location 5 Oakland Roads
Annual Recommended Maintenance No Bid $429.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $125.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $125.00
Location 6 Solid Waste and Recyling Division
Annual Recommended Maintenance No Bid $405.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $125.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $125.00
Location 7 Bloomington Elementary School
Annual Recommended Maintenance No Bid $465.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $125.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $125.00
Location 8 MEDCO Building
Annual Recommended Maintenance No Bid $1,137.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $125.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $125.00
Discount for parts is % discount from list 15% N/A
% markup from cost 25%




Ashby Fire Protection

Products ARK Systems

Section 2: Remote Monitoring Garrett Co. Health Center

Quarterly Monitoring Rate Per Quarter No Bid $60.00
Quarterly Monitoring Rate Annual $240.00
Section 3: Fire Extingisher Inspection and Services

A.21/21b. ABC $36.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $7.50 No Bid
6 year maintenance $7.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
B. 51b. ABC $46.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $11.00 No Bid
6 year maintenance $7.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
C.101b. ABC $76.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $17.85 No Bid
6 year maintenance $7.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
D. 20 1b. ABC $154.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $25.00 No Bid
6 year maintenance $7.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
E.21/21b. CO2 No Bid No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge No Bid No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid
F.51b. CO2 $127.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $14.00 No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test $13.00 No Bid
G. 101b. CO2 $186.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $15.00 No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test $13.00 No Bid
H. 151b. CO2 $213.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $20.00 No Bid




Ashby Fire Protection

Products ARK Systems
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test $13.00 No Bid
I. 20 Ib. CO2 $260.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $24.00 No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test $13.00 No Bid
J. 30 Ib. CO2 No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Recharge No Bid No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid
K.21/21b. HALON $119.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $40.00 includes chemical No Bid
6 year maintenance $17.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
L. 51b. HALON $180.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $100.00 includes chemical No Bid
6 year maintenance $27.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
M. 9 1b. HALON $365.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $180.00 includes chemical No Bid
6 year maintenance $43.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
N. 10 Ib. HALON No Bid No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $200.00 includes chemical No Bid
6 year maintenance $47.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
O. 11b. BC No Bid No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge No Bid No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid
P.51b BC $44.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $11.00 No Bid
6 year maintenance $7.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
Q. 101b. BC $74.00 No Bid




Ashby Fire Protection

Products ARK Systems
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $17.85 No Bid
6 year maintenance $7.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
R.201b. BC $115.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $25.00 No Bid
6 year maintenance $7.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
S.2.51b CG $119.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $40.00 includes chemical No Bid
6 year maintenance $17.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
T.51b CG $180.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $100.00 includes chemical No Bid
6 year maintenance $27.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
U.91b CG $365.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $180.00 includes chemical No Bid
6 year maintenance $43.50 No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
V.251b CG No Bid No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge No Bid No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid
W. 9 1b K-Guard $138.00 No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $67.50 No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test $9.00 No Bid
X. 1251b PK $1,950.00 No Bid
Maintenance $40.00 No Bid
Recharge $400.00 includes chemical No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test $367.00 No Bid
Y. 110 Ib NIT No Bid No Bid
Maintenance $2.75 No Bid
Recharge $12.00 No Bid
6 year maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test $20.00 No Bid




Ashby Fire Protection

Products ARK Systems

Replacement Parts:

A. Gauge $6.00 No Bid
B. Valve Stem $6.00 No Bid
C."O" Ring $1.60 No Bid
D. Nozzle $5.00 No Bid
E. Hose Assembly $5.00 No Bid
F. Siphon Tube $5.00 No Bid
G. Wall Bracket $2.25 No Bid
H. Vehicle Bracket $15.00 No Bid
[. Collar Rings $1.00 No Bid
J. Pull Pins $0.75 No Bid
K. Cartridges List Price less 20% No Bid
L. Seal $0.25 No Bid
M. DOT Label $0.60 No Bid
N. Class Label $0.60 No Bid
O. OSHA Label $0.60 No Bid
P. Operating Label $0.60 No Bid
Q. Tag Cover $0.60 No Bid
R. Vinyl Tag $1.00 No Bid
S. Condemned Extinguisher $1.00 No Bid
T. Hanging of Extinguisher $2.75 No Bid




