
 
Motor Oil and Grease  

Bid #11-0602MO Bid Tabulation 
 

 PPC Lubricants Petrochoice Performance 
Enterprises 

Bedford Valley 
Petroleum 

5W-30 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 Choice AMSOIL OE 
Synthetic 

Coastal Synblend 

Gallon 6.87 6.48 22.80 4 qt. containers 7.13 
55 Gallon Drum 413.60 6.98 971.50 438.90 
Quart 2.65 35.50 5.70 2.46 
10W-30 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 Conoco ASB AMSOIL OE 
Synthetic 

Coastal Synblend 

Quart 2.55 35.50 5.70 2.42 
15W-40 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 Shell Rotella AMSOIL OE 
Synthetic 

Lubriguard CJ4 

Gallon 7.94 11.50 25.85 7.50 
55 Gallon Drum 472.45 12.00 1,153.45 484.00 
5 Gallon Pail 45.45 No Bid 122.70 2 2.5 gallon 47.75 
Quart 3.16 No Bid 6.60 3.13 
85W-140 Gear Lubricant  
Brand Name 

Mag 1 Conoco UNV GL AMSOIL Severe 
Gear Synthetic 

Extreme Pressure 

Coastal  

Gallon 9.96 8.50 66.00 4 qt. containers 7.35 
55 Gallon Drum 561.55 9.05 3,024.00 488.40 
1 Gallon Pail 54.25 72.00 316.25 5 gallon pail 47.50 
120 LB. Keg 22.80 222.00 963.60 16 gal. keg 147.00 
Multipurpose Tractor Fluid 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 UTF Choice UTH AMSOIL 
Synthetic 

Coastal Prem THF 

Gallon 6.63 6.30 37.20 4 qt containers 6.39 
55 Gallon Drum 440.00 6.67 1,599.95 422.40 
5 Gallon Pail 38.90 55.00 175.60 41.50 
Quart 8.77 gallon No Bid 9.30 2.48 
Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 
Heavy Duty Engine Oil       
Brand Name 

Shell Rotella T3 Shell Rotella AMSOIL OE 
Synthetic 

Shell Rotella  
Triple T 

Gallon 10.58 11.50 25.85 10.98 
55 Gallon Drum 617.65 12.00 1,153.45 715.00 
5 Gallon Pail 59.15 No Bid 122.70 2 2.5 gallons 71.20 
Quart 3.45 No Bid 6.60 15.15 
Transmission Fluid 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 ATF Conoco Power 
Drive 

AMSOIL 
Synthetic 
Powershift 

Coastal D/M 
ATF 

Gallon 6.84 7.50 No Bid 6.89 

55 Gallon Drum 411.95 8.00 1,806.30 422.40 



 PPC Lubricants Petrochoice Performance 
Enterprises 

Bedford Valley 
Petroleum 

5 Gallon Pail 40.45 72.00 195.85 41.50 
Quart 2.40 No Bid No Bid 2.54 
Multipurpose Lithium 
Complex Grease  Brand Name 

Castrol Pyroplex Red 
#2 

Conoco Dynalife AMSOIL 
Synthetic  

Shell Retinax WR 
#2 

Gallon No Bid No Bid 208.70 35 lb.lug No Bid 
55 Gallon Drum 936.00 779.00 2,010.35 400 lb. drum No Bid 
120 LB. Keg 302.40 268.00 650.65 346.80 
Tube 2.46 2.52 7.30 3.19 
10W-40 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 Mobil Special AMSOIL Gulf 

Gallon 8.21 No Bid 38.10 No Bid  
55 Gallon Drum 479.05 No Bid 1,674.35 No Bid 
5 Gallon Pail 49.20 2 2.5 gallon No Bid 182.90 2 2.5 gallons No Bid 
Quart 2.38 3.35 9.70 2.57 
80W-90 High Performance 
Gear Oil       Brand Name 

Mag 1 No Bid AMSOIL 
Synthetic 

Coastal 

Gallon 9.96 No Bid 39.30 7.85 
55 Gallon Drum 561.55 No Bid 1,721.70 472.45 
120 LB. Keg 220.80 No Bid 569.35 16 gal keg 200.96 
Tube No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Bottle (32 oz.) 3.23 No Bid 10.00 11.52 
Power Steering Fluid 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 Conoco Hand 
Power 

AMSOIL 
Synthetic 

Pennzoil  

Gallon Bottle 8.70 2.00 No Bid 2.55 
Quart 2.34 24.00 13.90 No Bid 

Notes: Performance Enterprises LLC is n independent dealer of AMSOIL Inc.  Prices do not include shipping.  See 
Attached AMSOIL Inc. product warranty statement.  Product literature attached, more information and MSDS available 
upon request.  Prices based on AMSOIL retail prices as of 5/31/11, subject to change by AMSOIL Inc at any time, next 
price increase announced for July 1, 2011.  Garrett County will be established as a Commercial Account with AMSOIL 
Inc.  Performance Enterprises LLC will be the servicing dealer.  Wholesale pricing will apply as well as volume discounts.  
See attached Commercial Account Literature.  


