Contractual Snow Removal Services

Bid #11-0929SR Bid Tabulation

K & R Enterprises Here to Help, LLC Roger Newman D.B.K. Georges Creek Stone & Winters General
Section A - County Locations LLC Snow Plowing Gravel Contractors, Inc.
Location 1 - Public Services Center Lot
Option A - Current Lot
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $10.00 $20.00
Location 1 - Public Services Center Lot
Option B - Current Lot with Side Lot
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $10.00
Location 2 - Catholic Church Lot
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $10.00 $10.00
Methodist Church Lot 1
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $10.00 $10.00
Methodist Church Lot 2
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $5.00 $10.00
Alder Street Parking Lot
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $5.00 $10.00
Location 2 Grand Total (All 4 Lots)
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $35.00 $40.00
Location 3 - Animal Shelter/Health Lab
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $10.00
Location 4 - Visitors Center Lot
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives No Bid No Bid $65.00 $75.00 No Bid No Bid
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $22.00 $30.00
Location 5 - Health Center Lots
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $180.00 No Bid $130.00 No Bid No Bid $100.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $40.00 $22.00 $25.00
Location 6 - MEDCO Building
Option A - Full Lot
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $20.00 $20.00




K & R Enterprises Here to Help, LLC Roger Newman D.B.K. Georges Creek Stone & Winters General
LLC Snow Plowing Gravel Contractors, Inc.
Location 6 - MEDCO Building
Option B - Only 2 Plow Swipes &Garage Doors
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives $40.00 No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $10.00 $15.00
Location 7 - Bumble Bee Refuse Site
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $22.00
Location 8- Kings Run Refuse Site
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid $60.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $18.00 $25.00
Location 9 - Weber Road Refuse Site
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives No Bid No Bid $59.00 No Bid No Bid $60.00
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $18.00 $25.00
Location 10- Friendsville Refuse Site
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives No Bid No Bid No Bid $95.00 No Bid No Bid
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $40.00
Location 11- Michael Road and
Russell Road (portions as directed)
Plowing & Applying Winter Abrasives No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0 No Bid
Applying Winter Abrasives Only $10.75
Section B - Plowing and/or Treating
County Roads - As Directed
1. Oakland Garage Surrounding Areas
(as requested)per hour No Bid $60.00/$95.00 $75.00 No Bid No Bid $75.00
Plowing and/or Applying Winter Abrasives
2. Accident Garage Surrounding Areas
(as requested) per hour No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00
Plowing and/or Applying Winter Abrasives
3. Grantsville Garage Surrounding
Areas (as requested) per hour No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00
Plowing and/or Applying Winter Abrasives

Notes: Here to Help - We are only interested in plowing in Bloomington - Savage Road area. We have a stockpile area in Bloomington for storing abrasives. We can load the
Abrasives.
DBK Snow Removal - TS-110 4WD with 8 ¥ Blower, $85.00 Hr.
Georges Creek Stone & Gravel - Billing GCRD for $10.75 per ton of winter abrasives. No charge for plowing of road.




