Garrett County
Sheritf's Department & Detention Center Uniforms

Bid #11-0630U Bid Tabulation
Bid Allegany Embroidery +
Hem |[Description Howard Uniform Company Galls Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc. F&F and A. Jacobs & Sons, Inc. Uniforms, Inc, Souther Police Supply
Quantity] Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 |Tek Twill Short Sleeve Tactical Shirt-Brown 34 36.45 3,061.80] 342.94 3,606.96| 547.50 990.00, 546.00, 3,864.00] $59.99 5,039.16[No Bid No Bid
2 {Tek Twill Long Sleeve Tactical Shiri-Brown 34 39.65 3, €0 b44.94/ 3,774.96) 51.50] b4,326.00) 548.00 34,032.00] 64 89 5,459.16|No Bid No Bid
3 [Men's Tek Twill Tacticat Cargo Panis-Brown 1 b47 .25 3,827.25| $40.00 3,240.00| $53.55 54,337.55 350.00 54,050.00 347 .99 3,887.19/No Bid No Bid
4 |Women's Tek Twill Tactical Cargo Pants-Brown 3 547.25 $141.75| $40.00 $120.00] 53.55 $160.65| 50.00] $150.00] 547.99 $143.97No Bid No Bid
5 |[Tr-Spec 24-7 Short Sieeve Uniform Shirt-Black 30 34.25! $2,740.00 35.00 $2,800.00] $44.50 $3,560.00] 548.00 $3,840.00| 549.99 $3,999.20] 54.60 $4,368.00;
6 [Men's Tru-Spec 24-7 Pants-Khaki 68 29.75 $2,023.00 29.50 $2,006.001 32.90 $2,237.20 $40.00| $2,720.00] 32.89! $2,243.32 344 95| $3,056 .60
7__{Women's Tru-Spec 24-7 Pants-Khaki 2 29.75 $357.00 $29.50 $354.00] 32.90 $394 80 $40.00 $480.00] 32.99 $395. 39,75 $477.00
Grand Total $15,481 40| $15,901.92 $19,006.20 $19,136.00] $21,167.88 $7,901.60!




