
 
Motor Oil and Grease  

Bid #12-0607MO Bid Tabulation 
 

 PetroChoice PPC Lubricants Bedford Valley 
Petroleum 

Oakland Oil 

5W-30 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Advantage SB 5W30 
GF-5 

Mag 1 5W30 Coastal Mag 1 

Gallon 6.90 6.84 8.10 8.95 
55 Gallon Drum 407.00 400.95 486.75 484.25 
Quart No bid 2.78 2.66 2.56 
10W-30 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Mobile Special x 1 Mag 1 10W30 Coastal No bid 

Quart 3.75 2.78 2.62 No bid 
15W-40 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Mobil Fleet Mag 1 15W40 CJ4 Lubriguard Mag 1 

Gallon 6.65 7.96 7.85 9.79 
55 Gallon Drum 393.25 462.55 559.90 611.80 
5 Gallon Pail 55.00 45.80 55.55 60.04 
Quart No bid 3.06 3.33 3.08 
85W-140 Gear Lubricant  
Brand Name 

Conoco Mag 1 85W140 Coastal Mag 1 

Gallon 9.44 9.96 8.12 9.56 
55 Gallon Drum 546.70 558.80 592.90 576.73 
1 Gallon Pail No bid 52.80/5 gal pail 53.90/5 gal pail 55.20/5 gal pail 
120 LB. Keg 225.00 239.20/16 gal keg 165.00 232.76 
Multipurpose Tractor Fluid 
Brand Name 

Advantage TH Fluid Mag 1 VTF Coastal Mag 1 

Gallon 6.85 6.56 7.39 7.57 
55 Gallon Drum 404.25 385.55 491.15 483.20 
5 Gallon Pail 39.25 39.55 49.30 40.37 
Quart No bid 9.72/gal 2.68 No bid 
Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 
Heavy Duty Engine Oil       
Brand Name 

Shell Shell Rotella T 
15W40 

Shell Rotella 
Triple T 

Shell Rotella 

Gallon 11.90 8.96 11.63 12.94 
55 Gallon Drum 682.00 523.05 757.90 759.00 
5 Gallon Pail No bid 51.05 75.05 No bid 
Quart No bid 3.65 4.05 4.30 
Transmission Fluid 
Brand Name 

Conoco Powerdrive 
30 

Castrol Trans C30 Coastal Mag 1 

Gallon 7.72 10.05 7.39 No bid 

55 Gallon Drum 452.10 576.40 493.90 538.36 
5 Gallon Pail 43.60 55.65 49.30 No bid 
Quart No bid No bid 2.73 2.27 



 PetroChoice PPC Lubricants Bedford Valley 
Petroleum 

Oakland Oil 

Multipurpose Lithium 
Complex Grease  Brand Name 

Conoco Dynalife 
HT-2 

Castrol Pyroplex 
Red #2 

Shell Retinax WR 
#2 

Mag 1 

Gallon No bid No bid No bid No bid 
55 Gallon Drum 872.00 992.00 No bid No bid 
120 LB. Keg 277.00 314.40 370.80 218.04 
Tube 2.52 2.87 3.35 1.96 
10W-40 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

No bid Mag 1 10W40 Gulf Mag 1 

Gallon No bid 8.56 No bid No bid 
55 Gallon Drum No bid 481.80 No bid No bid 
5 Gallon Pail No bid 50.20 No bid 53.71 
Quart No bid 2.79 2.21 4.06 
80W-90 High Performance 
Gear Oil       Brand Name 

Conoco Mag 1 80W90 Coastal Mag 1 

Gallon 9.06 9.89 8.12 No bid 
55 Gallon Drum 525.80 554.95 592.90 No bid 
120 LB. Keg 222.00 220.00 165.00 227.77 
Tube No bid No bid No bid No bid 
Bottle (32 oz.) No bid 3.45/qt No bid 3.47 
Power Steering Fluid 
Brand Name 

Honda Mag 1 Power 
Steering Fluid 

Pennzoil Mag 1 

Gallon Bottle No bid 9.22 No bid No bid 
Quart 1.83 2.52 2.55 3.43 
5W-30 Synthetic Blend GF-5 
Motor Oil         Brand Name 

Advantage SB Mag 1 5W30 Syn 
Blend 

Coastal Mag 1 

Gallon 6.90 6.94 8.10 No bid 
55 Gallon Drum 407.00 406.45 486.75 829.15 
120 LB. Keg 172.00 No bid No bid No bid 
5 Gallon Pail 39.50 40.45 No bid No bid 
1 Gallon Pail No bid No bid No bid No bid 
Quart No bid 2.88 No bid 4.46 

Notes: Oakland Oil - *Escalator Clause* Prices will increase or decrease with market conditions due to the volatility of the  
                  Petroleum market. 


