1-Ton Truck
Bid Tabulation Bid #13-0627

Hertrich Fleet Criswell Chevrolet Billy Bender Timbrook Ford Team One Whiteside of St.
Clairsville, Inc.
Truck Chassis 2014 2014 2014 2014 2014 2014
Year
Make Ford Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet Chevrolet
Model F350 CK31403 Silverado 3500 HD F350 chassis cab 1 ton reg cab CK31403 4x4 Silverado
Price $26,489.00 $26,992.00 $26,403.00 $25,486.20 $28,016.00 $27,648.00
Utility Body Knapheide Knapheide Knapheide Knapheide per JJ Truck Knapheide Knapheide
Make Equipment
Model 6132D5460] 6132D5460] 6132D5460] 6132D5460] 6132D5460] service/crane 6132D5460]
body
Price $10,075.00 $10,500.00 *$11,090.00 $19,595.00 $19,895.00 $16,459.00
1-Ton Crane Liftmoore Liftmore Stahl AutoCrane per JJ Truck AutoCrane Auto Crane
Standard Reach Equipment
Model 121 L21 2000C-5-E Econoton IIR Econotron II short pedestal Econo-Ton 11
Price $2,870.00 $3,000.00 $4,560.00 $2,350.00 Included in Body Price $3,300.00
1-Ton Crane Liftmoore Liftmore Stahl No Bid Above crane extends to 7’ 1” Auto Crane 4’2” to
Optional Extended Reach 717
Model L-21-7-5 L-21-7-5 2000C-5-E No Bid Econo-Ton 11
Price $3,070.00 $3,200.00 $5,185.00 No Bid Included in above price $3,300.00
Light Bar Whelen Whelen Vangard 20” - 20”Long Low Long Low Profile 20” Amber Whelan
Make Profile Amber Light Bar Light Bar
Price $185.00 $200.00 $375.00 Included with JJ Truck Included in above price $990.00
Equipment specs
Total Price $39,619.00 $40,692.00 $42,428.00 $47,431.20 $47,911.00 $48,397.00
Standard Reach
Total Price $39,819.00 $40,892.00 $43,053.00 No Bid $47,911.00 $48,397.00
Extended Reach
Discount on Replacement 5% 25% 33% 20%
Parts - -
Delivery Time 120-150 Days 180 Days 8 - 12 Weeks 60-75 Days 160 Days Est. 120 Days
Calendar Days ARO

Notes: Criswell Chevrolet - We have included a heavy duty battery and alternator. We are also including and extra leaf spring on crane side to minimize lean. Note: other dealers probably

won’t include these since they were not required in spec.

Billy Bender - * Includes remaining accessories per your specifications.

Team One - This bid is for a 2014 model year. The autocrane is a power lift and manual rotation and brake. To add power rotation add $2,350.00 to above price.
Whiteside of St. Clairsville, Inc. - F.O.B Oakland, 0% 30 Days Net




