
                                                                                   Crushed Stone Aggregates
                                                                                Bid #13-0523CS Bid Tabulation
                                                                        Section 1: Pick Up Price at Plant by Roads Department

Stone Size Maryland Minerals
George's Creek Stone & 

Gravel
Keystone Deep Creek 

Quarry
Keystone Cranesville 

Quarry
Keystone Eichorn 

Quarry
#1 Stone $10.50 $10.00 No Bid $10.50 $10.50
#2 Stone $10.50 $10.00 No Bid $10.50 $10.50
#8 Washed $16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.00
#8 Unwashed $15.00 $14.00 No Bid $14.25 $16.00
#10 Stone $8.00 $10.00 No Bid $6.75 $8.00
CR1 Stone $8.50 $7.75 No Bid $8.50 No Bid$ $ $
CR6 Stone $8.50 $7.75 $8.50 $8.50 $8.50
CRD Stone $7.75 $4.00 No Bid $7.50 No Bid
#57 Washed $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#67 Washed $12.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#4 Grizzly Mat'l No Bid No Bid $5.50 $5.50 No Bid
Rip Rap $10 50 $10 00 No Bid $10 50 $10 50Rip Rap $10.50 $10.00 No Bid $10.50 $10.50
                                                                          Section 2: Pick Up Price at Plant by Public Utilities
#2 Stone $10.50 $10.00 No Bid $10.50 $10.50
#8 Washed $16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.00
#10 Stone $8.00 $10.00 No Bid $6.75 $8.00
CR6 Stone $8.50 $7.75 $8.50 $8.50 $8.50
#57 W h d $12 00 N Bid N Bid N Bid N Bid#57 Washed $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
                                                                         Section 3: Pick Up Price at Plant by Solid Waste
#1 Stone $10.50 No Bid No Bid $10.50 $10.50
#2 Stone $10.50 No Bid No Bid $10.50 $10.50
#8 Unwashed $15.00 No Bid No Bid $14.25 $16.00
#10 Stone $8.00 No Bid No Bid $6.75 $8.00
CR6 Stone $8.50 No Bid $8.50 $8.50 $8.50
#57 Washed $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap $10.50 No Bid No Bid $10.50 $10.50
                                                                          Section 4: Delivered Price to Solid Waste
#1 Stone $16.20 No Bid No Bid $18.35 $19.00
#2 Stone $16.20 No Bid No Bid $18.35 $19.00#2 Stone $16.20 No Bid No Bid $18.35 $19.00
#8 Unwashed $10.70 No Bid No Bid $22.10 $24.50
#10 Stone $13.70 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $16.50
CR6 Stone $14.20 No Bid $15.75 $16.35 $17.00
#57 Washed $17.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap $16.20 No Bid No Bid $18.35 $19.00
Notes: Maryland Minerals All material quoted from our Thayerville Quarry located at 414 Quarry Road Oakland MD minimum loadNotes: Maryland Minerals - All material quoted from our Thayerville Quarry located at 414 Quarry Road, Oakland, MD.  minimum load.
                                                  Delivered prices are for a 20-Ton 
Keystone Lime - Eichorn Quarry located at 1136 Zehner/Christner Hollow Road near Springs, PA   Delivered prices are for 20-Ton minimu
Keystone Lime - Deep Creek Quarry located at 554 Crabtree Bottom Road, McHenry, MD  Delivered prices are for 20-Ton minimum loads. 
Keystone Lime - Cranesville Quarry located at Route 2, Box 135C1, Reckarts Mill Road, near Cranesville, WV.  Delivered prices are for 20-T


