Mountain Lake Park and Loch Lynn Heights
Water Line Replacement Bid #13-0808
Bid Tabulation

Little Mountain Pipeline,
Winters Knieriem Construction LLC BYCO Enterprises A.L.L. Construction Frank Arnold
Item # |Description Quantity [Unit |Unit Cost |Total Price  [Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost  |Total Price  |Unit Cost  |Total Price  |Unit Cost  |Total Price  [Unit Cost Total Price
1 6" C909 Class 200 Pipe 140 LF $30.00 $4,200.00 $46.61 $6,525.40 $42.00 $5,880.00 $45.25 $6,335.00 $65.00 $9,100.00 $54.00[ $7,560.00
2 |2" DR 13.5 Pipe (Open Cut) 1425 LF $30.00 $42,750.00 $24.71 $35,211.75 $32.00 $45,600.00 $34.40 $49,020.00 $34.00 $48,450.00 $28.00] $39,900.00
3 |1I"CTS DR 9 (Open Cut) 110 LF $25.00 $2,750.00 $39.03 $4,293.30 $30.00 $3,300.00 $28.70 $3,157.00 $30.00 $3,300.00 $26.00] $2,860.00
3/4" Water Service Connection on Header
4 |Side of Road 11 EA $800.00 $8,800.00 $1,261.23 $13,873.53 $500.00 $5,500.00 $612.00 $6,732.00 $450.00 $4,950.00 $1,700.00( $18,700.00
3/4" Water Service Connection
5 |w/Trenchless Road Crossing 8 EA | $1,500.00 | $12,000.00 | $2,030.00 $16,240.00 $1,800.00 | $14,400.00 | $1,458.00 | $11,664.00 | $1,100.00 $8,800.00 $2,880.00( $23,040.00
3/4" Water Service Connection w/Open Cut
6 |Road Crossing 5 EA | $2,000.00 | $10,000.00 | $1,456.96 $7,284.80 $1,900.00 $9,500.00 $1,175.00 $5,875.00 $850.00 $4,250.00 $2,000.00( $10,000.00
7 |6" Gate Valve w/Box & Lid 1 EA | $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,243.52 $1,243.52 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,035.00 $1,035.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $4,155.00[ $4,155.00
8 [2" Ball Valve w/Box & Lid 3 EA | $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $568.40 $1,705.20 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $650.00 $1,950.00 $850.00 $2,550.00 $1,125.00f $3,375.00
9 |1" Ball Valve w/Box & Lid 1 EA | $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $469.80 $469.80 $800.00 $800.00 $385.00 $385.00 $650.00 $650.00 $625.00 $625.00
10 |2" Blowoff Assembly 2 EA | $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,276.58 $2,553.16 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $1,050.00 $2,100.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,525.00f $3,050.00
11 |1" Blowoff Assembly 1 EA | $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,363.00 $1,363.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $675.00 $675.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,135.00f $1,135.00
12 |Asphalt Trench Repair 198 SY $75.00 $14,850.00 $83.52 $16,536.96 $80.00 $15,840.00 $67.00 $13,266.00 $110.00 $21,780.00 $76.00] $15,048.00
13 |Full Width 2" Asphalt Overlay 2580 SY $14.00 $36,120.00 $15.78 $40,712.40 $13.75 $35,475.00 $13.75 $35,475.00 $18.00 $46,440.00 $54.00| $139,320.00
14 [Select Backfill 137 CY $50.00 $6,850.00 $23.32 $3,194.84 $30.00 $4,110.00 $158.25 $21,680.25 $40.00 $5,480.00 $40.00| $5,480.00
15 |2" Compound Meter Assembly 1 EA $800.00 $800.00 $394.40 $394.40 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $360.00 $360.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $750.00 $750.00
16 [Mobilization/Demobilization 1 LS $7,173.50 $7,173.50 $4,640.00 $4,640.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $13,480.00|] $13,480.00
Total Bid Price $155,793.50 $156,242.06 $158,705.00 $165,709.25 $170,350.00 $288,478.00
2a |2" DR 13.5 Pipe (Trenchless Installation) 1425 LF $20.00 $28,500.00 $24.36 $34,713.00 $28.00 $39,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $35,625.00
3a |1"CTS DR 9 (Trenchless Installation) 110 LF $25.00 $2,750.00 $33.64 $3,700.40 $26.00 $2,860.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.00 $2,640.00




