

**Fire Prevention Systems Services
Bid #14-1113FP Bid Tabulation**

Section 1	Pillar Innovations	Ark Systems	Fire Protection Products, Inc.
Fire Sprinkler Systems, Fire Pumps, Back Flow Preventers, Fire Alarms and Hood Suppression Systems			
Location 1 Garrett County Health Center			
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers	\$1,663.00	\$876.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms	\$726.00	\$1,312.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Location 2 Garrett County Community Action Center			
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers	\$997.00	\$810.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms	\$298.00	\$452.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Hood Suppression	\$298.00	\$315.00	\$90.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	\$25.00
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	\$25.00
Location 3 Garrett County Courthouse			
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers	\$997.00	\$710.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms	\$642.00	\$710.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Hood Suppression	\$298.00	\$450.00	\$90.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	\$25.00
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	\$35.00
Location 4 Garrett County Vistiors Center			
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers	\$272.00	\$390.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Location 5 Solid Waste and Recycling Division			
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers	\$295.00	\$390.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Location 6 Kitzmiller School			
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms	\$248.00	\$406.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid

	Pillar Innovations	Ark Systems	Fire Protection Products, Inc.
Location 7 Adventure Sports Center International			No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers	\$997.00	\$800.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms	\$172.00	\$358.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Location 8 Garrett County Oakland Road Garage			
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms	\$406.00	\$776.00	No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F)	\$65.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Overtime Rate	\$85.00	\$125.00	No Bid
Discount for parts is % discount from list	30%	No Bid	20%
% markup from cost	No Bid	25%	No Bid
Section 2 - Monitoring			
Remote Monitoring Garrett County Health Center			
Quarterly Monitoring Rate	\$71.25	\$60.00	No Bid
Remote Monitoring Adventure Sports Center International			
Quarterly Monitoring Rate	\$71.25	\$60.00	No Bid
Remote Monitoring Kitzmiller School			
Quarterly Monitoring Rate	\$71.25	\$60.00	No Bid
Section 3 - Fire Extingisher Inspection and Services			
A. 2 1/2 lb. ABC	\$39.50	No Bid	\$36.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$25.00	No Bid	\$7.50
6 year Maintenance	\$10.00	No Bid	\$7.50
Hydro Test	\$39.50	No Bid	\$9.00
B. 5 lb. ABC	\$42.50	No Bid	\$46.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$25.00	No Bid	\$11.00
6 year Maintenance	\$10.00	No Bid	\$7.50
Hydro Test	\$42.50	No Bid	\$9.00
C. 10 lb. ABC	\$68.00	No Bid	\$76.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$40.00	No Bid	\$17.85
6 year Maintenance	\$15.00	No Bid	\$7.50
Hydro Test	\$68.00	No Bid	\$9.00
D. 20 lb. ABC	\$130.00	No Bid	\$154.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$54.00	No Bid	\$25.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	\$7.50
Hydro Test	\$120.00	No Bid	\$9.00
E. 2 1/2 lb. CO2	\$120.00	No Bid	No Bid
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$80.00	No Bid	No Bid
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	\$120.00	No Bid	No Bid
F. 5 lb. CO2	\$131.00	No Bid	\$127.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75

	Pillar Innovations	Ark Systems	Fire Protection Products, Inc.
Recharge	\$80.00	No Bid	\$14.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	\$130.00	No Bid	\$13.00
G. 10 lb. CO2	\$194.00	No Bid	\$186.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$150.00	No Bid	\$15.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	\$180.00	No Bid	\$13.00
H. 15 lb. CO2	\$221.00	No Bid	\$213.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$180.00	No Bid	\$20.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	\$200.00	No Bid	\$13.00
I. 20 lb. CO2	\$270.00	No Bid	\$260.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$210.00	No Bid	\$24.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	\$250.00	No Bid	\$13.00
J. 30 lb. CO2	\$405.00	No Bid	No Bid
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	No Bid
Recharge	\$325.00	No Bid	No Bid
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	\$375.00	No Bid	No Bid
K. 2 1/2 lb. HALON	N/A	No Bid	\$119.00
Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	N/A	No Bid	*\$40.00
6 year Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$17.50
Hydro Test	N/A	No Bid	\$9.00
L. 5 lb. HALON	N/A	No Bid	\$180.00
Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	N/A	No Bid	*\$100.00
6 year Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$27.50
Hydro Test	N/A	No Bid	\$9.00
M. 9 lb. HALON	N/A	No Bid	\$365.00
Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	N/A	No Bid	*\$180.00
6 year Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$43.50
Hydro Test	N/A	No Bid	\$9.00
N. 10 lb. HALON	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	N/A	No Bid	*\$200.00
6 year Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$47.50
Hydro Test	N/A	No Bid	\$9.00
O. 1 lb. BC	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
6 year Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	N/A	No Bid	No Bid

	Pillar Innovations	Ark Systems	Fire Protection Products, Inc.
P. 5 lb BC	\$35.50	No Bid	\$44.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$20.00	No Bid	\$11.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	\$7.50
Hydro Test	\$35.50	No Bid	\$9.00
Q. 10 lb. BC	\$61.00	No Bid	\$74.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$35.00	No Bid	\$17.85
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	\$7.50
Hydro Test	\$61.00	No Bid	\$9.00
R. 20 lb. BC	\$93.00	No Bid	\$115.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$60.00	No Bid	\$25.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	\$7.50
Hydro Test	\$80.00	No Bid	\$9.00
S. 2.5 lb CG	\$115.00	No Bid	\$109.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$100.00	No Bid	*\$40.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	\$17.50
Hydro Test	\$100.00	No Bid	\$9.00
T. 5 lb CG	\$172.00	No Bid	\$164.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$160.00	No Bid	*\$100.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	\$27.50
Hydro Test	\$160.00	No Bid	\$9.00
U. 9 lb CG	\$348.00	No Bid	\$333.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$330.00	No Bid	*\$180.00
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	\$43.50
Hydro Test	\$330.00	No Bid	\$9.00
V. 25 lb CG	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
6 year Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
W. 9 lb K-Guard	\$65.00	No Bid	\$138.00
Maintenance	\$6.00	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	\$60.00	No Bid	\$67.50
6 year Maintenance	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	\$65.00	No Bid	\$9.00
X. 125 lb PK	\$1,998.00	No Bid	\$1,950.00
Maintenance	\$50.00	No Bid	\$40.00
Recharge	\$1,500.00	No Bid	*\$400.00
6 year Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	N/A	No Bid	\$367.00
Y. 110 lb NIT	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	\$2.75
Recharge	N/A	No Bid	\$12.00

	Pillar Innovations	Ark Systems	Fire Protection Products, Inc.
6 year Maintenance	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
Hydro Test	N/A	No Bid	\$20.00
Replacement Parts:			
A. Gauge	\$4.00	No Bid	\$6.00
B. Valve Stem	\$6.00	No Bid	\$6.00
C. "O" Ring	\$5.00	No Bid	\$1.60
D. Nozzle	\$45.00	No Bid	\$5.00
E. Hose Assembly	\$50.00	No Bid	\$5.00
F. Siphon Tube	\$50.00	No Bid	\$5.00
G. Wall Hanger	\$5.00	No Bid	\$2.25
H. Vehicle Bracket	\$16.00	No Bid	\$15.00
I. Collar Rings	\$3.00	No Bid	\$1.00
J. Pull Pins	\$1.00	No Bid	\$0.75
K. Cartridges	\$85.00	No Bid	List Price less 20%
L. Installation	\$10.00	No Bid	\$2.75
M. Condemned	\$1.00	No Bid	\$1.00
N. Fire Extinguisher Cover - Small	\$17.50	No Bid	\$13.00
O. Fire Extinguisher Cover - Medium	\$18.00	No Bid	\$14.75
P. Fire Extinguisher Cover - Large	\$20.00	No Bid	\$16.00
Q. Weatherproof Tag	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.00
Minimum Stop Fee	\$20.00	No Bid	\$25.00 if service does not meet this amount

Notes: Pillar - Note that on the Fire Extinguisher Inspection and Services , when we do a 6 year Maintenance, you will also be charged for a recharge as well.
Fire Protection Products - * Includes Chemical