LED Light Tubes Bid #14-0320

Bid Tabulation
Green Edge HD Supply Facilites LED Smart USA Ideal Electrical
Lighting LLC Maintenance Ltd GNP Energy LLC A1l Restoration Inc. Scott Electric Supply Corp Fastenal
Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
Item # |Description Quantity | Price | Total Price | Unit Price Total Price Price | Total Price | Price | Total Price| Price | Total Price Price Total Price | Price |Total Price| Price | Total Price
$219.00 per | $61,977.00 (283
1 4'18W LED Tube 2,828 $20.90 | $59,105.20 Case of 10 Cases of 10) $24.95 | $70,558.60 | $25.41 | $71,859.48 | $27.08 | $76,582.24 | $28.212 | $79,783.54 | $32.57 [$92,107.96| $58.15| $164,448.20
2 2'10W LED Tube 46 $15.75 $724.50 No Bid No Bid $18.95 | $871.70 $33.93 | $1,560.78 | $19.25 $885.50 $19.753 $908.64 $28.36 | $1,304.56 | $42.06 $1,934.76
Grand Total $59,829.70 $61,977.00 $71,430.30 $73,420.26 $77,467.74 $80,692.17 $93,412.52 $166,382.96
3 3'14W LED Tube 52 $19.40 | $1,008.80 No Bid No Bid $21.95%| $1,141.40 | $35.33 | $1,837.16 | $20.45 $1,063.40 $32.529 $1,691.51 $30.00 | $1,560.00 | $49.29 $2,563.08
4 U-Tube 15W 56 $28.00 | $1,568.00 No Bid No Bid $26.95*| $1,509.20 | $43.75 | $2,450.00 | $30.65 $1,716.40 $36.165 $2,025.24 $42.36 | $2,372.16 |No Bid |No Bid
Deliver tubes within 14 days from
receipt of order Yes or No Yes No No No No No No Yes
Complete Order to be
If no, number of days required to delivered in 3 -4 6 - 8 Weeks
deliver tubes from receipt of order 15 Business Days ARO 14 - 21 Days 20 Business Days 20-28 Days Weeks (42 - 56 Days)

Notes: Green Edge - 4 ft & 2 ft tubes are DLC, 3 ft & U-tube are U.L., U-Tube DLC applied for

GNP Energy - 14 Days if 3000K or 4000K, 21 Days for 3500K * Not DLC Listed 3' tube 15W and U-Tube 18W
A1 Restoration, Inc. - All tubes are 3500K, frosted, internal drivers, power to one end

Scott Electric Co - All lamps except 3' LED Tubes are DL.C compliant

Fastenal - 10 Year Warranty

The following bids are considered nonresponsive because they were submitted on the incorrect bid form: LED Solar and Light Company, Complete Facilities Supply, GB Energie LED LLC, VaOpto, GoGreen Lighting LLC
and DiVi Energy, LLC.




