Vehicles Bid #14-1016

Bid Tabulation
Full Size 4X4 Sport Utility Hertrich Fleet Sport Chevrolet Billy Bender
Vehicle Services Criswell Chevrolet Co. Chevrolet Team One
Year 2015 2015 2015 2015 2015
Make Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet

Tahoe 4WD w/Special

Model Tahoe CK15706 4x4 Tahoe CK15706 Service Package Tahoe Tahoe CK15706 4x4
Price $31,938.00 $32,009.00 $32,798.00 $34,389.00 $38,297.00
Total Price for 3 Units $95,814.00 $96,027.00 $98,394.00 $103,167.00 $114,891.00
Delivery Time from Date of
Order 60-90 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days 150 Calendar Days 40-72 Calendar Days 120 Calendar Days
Warranty 3 yrs/ 36,000 mi basic 3 yrs/36,000 mi 3 yrs/36,000 mi 5 yrs/100,000 mi -
Van - Option 1
Year 2015 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make Toyota No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model Sienna LE AWD #5366 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price $31,370.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time from Date of
Order 120-150 Calendar Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty 3 yrs/ 36,000 mi basic No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Van - Option 2
Year 2015 2015 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make Nissan Nissan No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model NV200SV Model 67215 | NV200SV Model 67215 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price $20,993.00 $22,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time from Date of
Order 90-150 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty 5 yrs/100,000 mi basic 5 yrs /100,000 mi No Bid No Bid No Bid

Notes: Hertrich - Tahoes - 3.42 rear axle requires Max Trailering pkg which also requires aluminum wheels. This may be deleted for a credit

of $890.00. The Tahoe would have standard tow pkg with a 3.08 rear axle ratio.

Criswell - Tahoe rear axle ratio 3.08. Seat code with bucket seats and console delete is AZ3. Onstar delete, also delete

Bluetooth for phone. Add #85 per Tahoe for Bluetooth.

Team One - GM order system would not let me select option9G8 (delete daytime headlights control). All 3 will have daytime running lights

and automatic headlamp control.




