Standby Generators Bid #16-0317

Bid Tabulation
*Frank Arnold
Location # 1 Oakwood East Contractors, Inc. R.C. Newman, LLC Beitzel Corporation
Bid Price $28,400.00 $36,931.00 $39,595.00
Options:
Cold Weather Kit $300.00 $337.00 $314.50
Cold Weather Kit Make/Model 006175-0 Generac 6175 Generac #006175-0
Extreme Cold Weather Kit $150.00 $176.00 $152.50
Extreme Cold Weather Kit Make/Model 006174-0 Generac 6174 Generac #006174-0
Contract Completion Calendar Days 90 Days 90 Days 60 Days
Generac RG02515ANSX
Make & Model of Generator 25 KW LP Generac RG02515ANSX | Generac QT02515ANSX
Generator Warranty 5 Year Limited 2 Years 5 Year
Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac RTSC200A3 Generac RTSW200A3 Generac RTSW200A3
Transfer Switch Warranty 5 Year Limited 2 Years 5 Year
Location #2 Underwood South
Bid Price $26,280.00 $36,825.00 $35,371.00
Options:
Cold Weather Kit $300.00 $337.00 $314.50
Cold Weather Kit Make/Model 006175-0 Generac 6175 Generac #006175-0
Extreme Cold Weather Kit $150.00 $176.00 $152.50
Extreme Cold Weather Kit Make/Model 006174-0 Generac 6174 Generac #006174-0
Contract Completion Calendar Days 90 Days 90 Days 60 Days
Generac RG0215ANSX
Make & Model of Generator 25 KW NG RGO02515ANSX Generac | Generac QT025ANSX
Generator Warranty 5 Year Limited 2 Years 5 Year
Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac RTSC200A3 RTSW200A3 Generac Generac RTSW200A3
Transfer Switch Warranty 5 Year Limited 2 Years 5 Year




Standby Generators Bid #16-0317

Bid Tabulation

*Frank Arnold
Location #3 Yough West Contractors, Inc. R.C. Newman, LLC Beitzel Corporation
Bid Price $31,900.00 No Bid $44,675.00
Options:
Cold Weather Kit $300.00 No Bid $314.50
Cold Weather Kit Make/Model 006175-0 No Bid Generac #006175-0
Extreme Cold Weather Kit $150.00 No Bid $152.50
Extreme Cold Weather Kit Make/Model 006174-0 No Bid Generac #006174-0
Contract Completion Calendar Days 90 Days No Bid 60 Days
Make & Model of Generator Generac RGO315ANSX No Bid Generac QT03015ANSX
Generator Warranty 5 Year Limited No Bid 5 Year
Make & Model of Transfer Switch RTSW300A3 No Bid Generac RTSW300A3
Transfer Switch Warranty 5 Year Limited No Bid 5 Year

Notes: The bid from Frank Arnold is considered nonresponsive because the required Bid Bond was not provided.
Beitzel Corporation - Our bid submission does not include any fees that may come from Columbia Gas of Maryland.




