Tires Bid #16-0414T Bid Tabulation

Glotfelty Enterprises Loch Lynn Service Center
Tire Estimated
Number | Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 116 $394.67 $45,781.72 $315.89 $36,643.24
2 52 $419.08 $21,792.16 $349.18 $18,157.36
3 164 $165.50 $27,142.00 $349.18 $57,265.52
4 120 $145.50 $17,460.00 $349.18 $41,901.60
5 38 $1,391.73 $52,885.74 $1,190.74 $45,248.12
6 32 $1,575.00 $50,400.00 $1,801.04 $57,633.28
7 8 $456.50 $3,652.00 $448.92 $3,591.36
8 8 $1,100.00 $8,800.00 $1,002.47 $8,019.76
9 42 $140.61 $5,905.62 $137.60 $5,779.20
10 38 $147.88 $5,619.44 $163.06 $6,196.28
11 8 $247.34 $1,978.72 $229.85 $1,838.80
12 10 $179.00 $1,790.00 $263.01 $2,630.10
13 10 $383.50 $3,835.00 $298.90 $2,989.00
14 4 $245.00 $980.00 $341.56 $1,366.24
15 13 $92.67 $1,204.71 $76.59 $995.67
16 4 $137.83 $551.32 $122.78 $491.12
17 10 $167.50 $1,675.00 $172.18 $1,721.80
18 8 $146.27 $1,170.16 $158.29 $1,266.32
19 4 $76.50 $306.00 $115.08 $460.32
20 4 $126.50 $506.00 No Bid No Bid
21 12 $470.00 $5,640.00 $555.59 $6,667.08
22 12 $325.00 $3,900.00 $320.38 $3,844.56
23 6 $176.50 $1,059.00 $152.82 $916.92
24 2 $1,945.00 $3,890.00 No Bid No Bid
25 4 $86.44 $345.76 $121.76 $487.04
26 2 $1.360.31 $2,720.62 No Bid No Bid
27 6 $695.00 $4,170.00 $645.23 $3,871.38
28 2 $127.00 $254.00 $108.80 $217.60
29 5 $92.67 $463.35 $76.59 $382.95
30 2 $1,630.00 $3,260.00 $2,020.70 $4,041.40
31 2 $1,910.00 $3,820.00 No Bid No Bid
32 2 $165.02 $330.04 $174.31 $348.62
33 2 $594.87 $1,189.74 $413.29 $826.58
34 2 $215.00 $430.00 $405.30 $810.60
35 2 $274.34 $548.68 $287.54 $575.08
36 2 $270.00 $540.00 $287.54 $575.08
37 2 $179.00 $358.00 $198.51 $397.02
38 4 $74.81 $299.24 $121.76 $487.04
39 2 $150.00 $300.00 $188.82 $377.64
40 2 $685.00 $1,370.00 $693.54 $1,387.08
41 6 $1,630.00 $9,780.00 $2,020.70 $12,124.20
42 4 $1,575.00 $6,300.00 $1,801.04 $7,204.16
43 2 $394.67 $789.34 $315.89 $631.78
44 4 $165.50 $662.00 $330.18 $1,320.72
45 2 $383.50 $767.00 $284.56 $569.12
46 8 $166.50 $1,332.00 $308.60 $2,468.80
47 2 $168.50 $337.00 No Bid No Bid
48 4 $146.30 $585.20 $137.60 $550.40
49 4 $144.76 $579.04 $158.29 $633.16
50 8 $174.12 $1,392.96 $178.63 $1,429.04
51 4 $96.50 $386.00 $115.08 $460.32
52 6 $236.15 $1,416.90 $196.84 $1,181.04
53 4 $126.50 $506.00 $119.18 $476.72




Glotfelty Enterprises

Loch Lynn Service Center

Tire Estimated
Number | Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
54 12 $117.50 $1,410.00 $121.76 $1,461.12
55 12 $157.50 $1,890.00 $143.78 $1,725.36
56 4 $169.50 $678.00 $137.60 $550.40
57 4 $104.01 $416.04 $135.34 $541.36
58 4 $101.94 $407.76 $125.19 $500.76
59 4 $168.50 $674.00 $158.29 $633.16
60 12 $133.50 $1,602.00 $140.41 $1,684.92
61 4 $153.20 $612.80 $178.63 $714.52
62 4 $139.74 $558.96 No Bid No Bid
63 14 $419.08 $5,867.12 $349.18 $4,888.52
64 2 $554.97 $1,109.94 No Bid No Bid
65 2 $630.00 $1,260.00 $443.71 $887.42
66 4 $179.00 $716.00 $198.51 $794.04
67 2 $685.00 $1,370.00 $693.54 $1,387.08
68 12 $138.50 $1,662.00 $142.52 $1,710.24
69 4 $120.50 $482.00 $111.44 $445.76
70 16 $157.50 $2,520.00 $143.78 $2,300.48
71 2 $164.99 $329.98 $174.31 $348.62
72 2 $139.41 $278.82 $174.31 $348.62
73 4 $100.43 $401.72 $125.19 $500.76
74 4 $138.50 $554.00 $135.46 $541.84
75 4 $80.55 $322.20 $126.78 $507.12
76 4 $165.50 $662.00 $148.72 $594.88
77 12 $113.11 $1,357.32 $142.20 $1,706.40
78 4 $158.50 $634.00 $137.60 $550.40
79 6 $236.15 $1,416.90 $205.99 $1,235.94
80 4 $61.17 $244.68 $86.39 $345.56
81 8 $117.01 $936.08 $144.06 $1,152.48
82 8 $104.78 $838.24 $132.70 $1,061.60
83 48 $147.88 $7,098.24 $178.63 $8,574.24
84 24 $160.16 $3,843.84 $158.71 $3,809.04
85 4 $125.39 $501.56 $140.69 $562.76
Grand Total $355,813.66 $391,523.62

Hourly Rates per Tire

Glotfelty Enterprises

Loch Lynn Service Center

Dismounting Charge

Passenger $6.00 $3.00
Mounting Charge

Passenger $6.00 $3.00
Spin Balancing Charge

Passenger $12.00 $3.00
Dismounting Charge

Light Truck $6.50 $3.00
Mounting Charge

Light Truck $6.50 $3.00
Spin Balancing Charge

Light Truck $13.00 $3.00
Dismounting Charge

Truck $16.00 $15.00
Mounting Charge

Truck $16.00 $15.00
Spin Balancing Charge

Truck $32.00 $15.00




Hourly Rates

Glotfelty Enterprises

Loch Lynn Service Center

Dismounting Charge

Other $37.50 No Bid
Mounting Charge

Other $37.50 No Bid
Spin Balancing Charge

Other No Bid No Bid
Disposal Charge

Passenger $4.00 $3.00
Disposal Charge

Light Truck $5.00 $3.00
Disposal Charge

Truck $10.00 $11.00
Disposal Charge

Other $70.00 No Bid
Hourly Rate for Onsite

Work $100.00 No Bid

Notes: Glotfelty Enterprises -Light Truck Delivery to Accident Roads Garage - Tuesday
Light Truck Delivery to Grantsville Roads Garage - Tuesday Non Goodyear Passenger
and Light Truck mounted & balanced N/C. New retreads purchased here mounted N/C.
Passenger Delivery to Accident, Grantsville & Oakland Roads Garages, Solid Waste

and Public Works Utilities - NC
Loch Lynn Service Center - Other Delivery to Accident Roads Garage - Tuesday

Other Delivery to Grantsville Roads Garage - Tuesday. Light Truck Delivery to Accident,
Grantsville & Oakland Roads Garages, Solid Waste and Public Works Utilities - N/C




