Culvert Pipe Bid #190502C

Bid Tabulation
Galvanized Drainage Pipe - Plain
- Chemung Supply Corp. Ferguson Enterprises Garrett Industrial Supply
Description | Gage | Cost per Fr. Bands Flared End | Cost per Ft. Bands Flared End | Cost per Ft. Bands Flared End
6” Perf 18 7.00 10.50 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12” 16 10.50 15.75 52.00 14.57 13.97 78.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” 16 13.30 19.95 70.00 18.07 17.56 98.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” 16 15.40 23.10 94.00 21.54 20.04 124.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid
21" 16 17.85 26.75 128.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" 16 20.40 30.60 145.00 28.50 26.72 185.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30” 16 25.00 31.50 298.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36” 14 36.00 54.00 393.00 42.43 38.46 534.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
42” 14 38.25 57.40 694.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" 14 44.00 66.00 822.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54” 14 50.00 75.00 995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60” 12 73.25 146.50 1330.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66” 12 79.50 159.00 1470.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" 12 86.50 173.00 1870.00 91.39 86.22 3474.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid
78" 12 94.50 189.00 2350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84" 10 123.75 247.50 2600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90” 10 134.00 268.00 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96” 10 143.00 286.00 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102" 10 162.00 486.00 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Polyethylene Corrugated Drainage Pipe
Chemung Supply Corp. Ferguson Enterprises Garrett Industrial Supply
Size Type Couplings Flared End Type Couplings Flared End Type Couplings Flared End
Smooth Sections Smooth Sections Smooth Sections
Interior Interior Interior
Diameter $/FT
127 4.66 8.52 134.37 5.15 9.41 148.48 5.35 9.80 154.44
15" 741 14.19 134.37 8.19 15.68 148.48 8.52 16.31 207.48
18” 9.21 24.18 180.51 10.18 26.72 199.46 10.59 27.79 207.48
247 15.35 34.10 231.66 16.96 37.68 255.98 17.64 39.19 266.27
30" 23.82 79.28 505.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 33.46 No Bid No Bid
36" 29.11 110.31 596.47 32.16 121.89 659.03 33.46 126.79 685.54
427 37.58 161.46 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48” 47.10 189.54 N/A 52.04 209.44 No Bid 54.14 217.86 No Bid
54" N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60” 69.85 294.84 N/A 77.18 325.79 No Bid 80.29 338.89 No Bid
Bid is for in-line bell type pipe Yes No Yes

Notes: Ferguson Enterprises - Galvanized Quoted, Bid asked for type II galvanized, but this does not exsist. 307, 42”, 54” not quoted because list of Est. Quantities. Did not include

these sizes.






