

**Chain & Augers
Bid #21-0422CA
Bid Tabulation**

	Chemung Supply Corp				Ironhawk Industrial Distribution LLC			
Chain	Brand	Part #	Unit	Price	Brand	Part #	Unit	Price
7/0 5/16 side chain	Pewag/CM	7/0 side	Box	\$384.00	No Bid	No Bid	Box	No Bid
7/0 MM cross link chain	Pewag/CM	3007	Bag	\$699.00	No Bid	No Bid	Bag	No Bid
8/0 11 link cross chain	Pewag/CM	E-6434	Box	\$349.60	No Bid	No Bid	Box	No Bid
8/0 MM twisted link cross chain	Pewag/CM	34311	Bag	\$502.10	No Bid	No Bid	Bag	No Bid
9/0 17 link cross chain	Pewag/CM	E-6640	Box	\$574.10	No Bid	No Bid	Box	No Bid
9/0 21 link cross chain	Pewag/CM	E-6650	Box	\$569.10	No Bid	No Bid	Box	No Bid
7/0 side chain		N/A	Box	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	Box	No Bid
9/0 side chain	Pewag/CM	314037-S	Box	\$455.00	No Bid	No Bid	Box	No Bid
9/0 cross chain	Pewag/CM	314037	Box	\$1344.00	No Bid	No Bid	Box	No Bid
Klip lock fasteners	Pewag/CM	#0312	Box	\$334.00	No Bid	No Bid	Box	No Bid
Lever fasteners (truck)	Pewag/CM	#0317	Each	\$490.00	No Bid	No Bid	Each	No Bid
Cross chain hooks (truck)	Pewag/CM	409	Each	\$139.00	No Bid	No Bid	Each	No Bid
Lever fasteners (equip)	Pewag/CM	F-8270	Each	\$275.00	No Bid	No Bid	Each	No Bid
Cross chain hooks (equip)	Pewag/CM		Each	\$212.00	No Bid	No Bid	Each	No Bid
Augers								
Single Auger	Elkin	Auger	Each	\$795.00			Each	\$544.64

Notes:.