1-Ton Trucks
Bid Tabulation Bid #15-1015

Team One Criswell Timbrook Win Kelly Diehls Ford
Chrysler Jeep Automotive Pontiac Buick
Dodge GMC
1-Ton Shop Truck
Truck Chassis
Year 2016 2016 2016 2016 No Bid
Make Chevrolet Dodge Ram 3500 Ford Chevrolet 3500 No Bid
HD 4WD Reg Cab
Model CK36403 1 DD8L64 *F350 Chassis Cab 3500 No Bid
Ton 4x4
Price $30,280.00 $30,449.00 $30,206.96 $28,691.00 No Bid
Utility Body
Make Knapheide Knapheide Knapheide Knapheide No Bid
Model 6132D5460] 6132D54S 6132D54] Service 6132D5460]1 No Bid
Body

Price $32,372.00 $10,600.00 $16,595.00 $9,505.00 No Bid
1-Ton Crane -
Optional Extended
Reach
Make Venturo Autocrane Autocrane Econo Ton II No Bid
Model ET16KX Econo Ton 11 Econo Ton 11 6500 ft. Ibs 12v DC No Bid

Electric Crane
Price See Notes $4,500.00 Included in $5,390.00 No Bid

Urtility Body
Light Bar
Make Ecco Whelan or 20 to 24” Low Buyers LED No Bid
Federal Profile Modular Light Bar
24” 36 Amber
LEDS
Price $1,216.00 $2,000.00 Included in $1,365.00 No Bid
Utility Body
Total Bid Price $63,868.00 $47,549.00 $46,801.96 $44,951.00 No Bid
Discount on 20% 10% 25% No Bid No Bid
Replacement Parts %
Delivery Time 150 Days 180 Days 8 - 10 Weeks 120 Days No Bid
Calendar Days
1-Ton Truck Cab &
Chassis Only
Year No Bid 2016 2016 No Bid 2016
Make No Bid Dodge Ram 5500 Ford No Bid Ford
Model No Bid DPOL63 *F550 4x4 No Bid F550
Chassis

Purchase Price No Bid $46,810.00 $44,718.90 No Bid $47,575.00
Discount on No Bid 10% 25% No Bid 20%
Replacement Parts %
Delivery Time for No Bid 120 Days 8 - 10 Weeks No Bid 50 Days
Dump Truck from
Date of Order
Calendar Days

Notes: Criswell - Received Addendums 1, 2, and 3. Chassis warranty 3 years/36,000 miles Basic. Drivetrain warranty 5
years/ 100,000 miles Diesel or 5 years 60,000 miles Gasoline Engines.
Timbrook Automotive — 1-Ton Shop Truck Model - 165” Wheelbase, Blue Jeans Metallic, 6.2 EFI V8 Gasoline Engine.
Delivery to Service Body installers 8 - 10 weeks after order is accepted by Ford Motor Company. 1-Ton Truck Cab & Chassis
Only Model - 141” Wheelbase, Blue Jeans Metallic. Delivery 8 -10 weeks after order is accepted by Ford Motor Company.
Diehls Ford - Includes fog lights to be added after the truck arrives. If you don’t need heated exterior mirrors, you may save

$800 as they come bundled with power windows, locks & mirrors. Rear axle quoted at 4.88 Limited slip.




