
 

Invitation to Bid #24-0411 
Culvert Pipe 

Bid Tabulation 
 
 
 

Galvanized Drainage Pipe - Plain 
  Core & Main, LP Chemung Supply Corp Garrett Industrial Supply Cox Piping Supply Geo Ternent Sons 

Description Gage Cost per 
Ft. 

Bands Flared End Cost per 
Ft. 

Bands Flared End Cost per 
Ft. 

Bands Flared End Cost per 
Ft. 

Bands Flared End Cost Per 
Ft 

Bands Flared End 

12” 16 $18.43 $40.93 $120.06 $21.00 $45.00 $128.00 $21.33 $21.33 $146.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.95 No Bid No Bid 

15” 16 $23.37 $44.58 $129.82 $25.00 $47.00 $138.00 $27.25 $27.25 $153.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.95 No Bid No Bid 

18” 16 $27.64 $47.90 $186.61 $29.50 $50.00 $198.00 $31.58 $31.58 $169.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.95 No Bid No Bid 

21” 16 $32.22 $50.67 $227.53 $34.00 $54.00 $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid 

24” 16 $37.51 $54.13 $297.39 $40.00 $58.00 $315.00 $41.67 $41.67 $246.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.95 No Bid No Bid 

30” 16 $46.74 $61.96 $650.79 $50.00 $65.00 $687.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.95 No Bid No Bid 

36” 14 $66.32 $69.79 $959.98 $70.00 $76.00 $1,100.00 $75.42 $75.42 $692.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.95 No Bid No Bid 

42” 14 $77.37 $82.67 $1,325.08 $82.00 $88.00 $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid 

48” 14 $87.16 $91.56 $1,485.00 $92.00 $97.00 $1,575.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid 

54” 14 $98.06 $113.32 $1,840.53 $104.00 $120.00 $1,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid 

60” 12 $151.35 $210.76 $2,184.74 $160.00 $222.00 $2,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $201.95 No Bid No Bid 

66” 12 $163.95 $273.97 $2,445.93 $173.00 $289.00 $2,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

72” 12 $181.42 $320.70 $3,245.11 $192.00 $338.00 $3,444.00 $225.00 $225.00 $6,562.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $244.95 No Bid No Bid 

78” 12 $217.40 $367.43 $3,516.67 $230.00 $389.00 $3,450.00 No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid 

84” 10 $263.17 $393.82 $3,789.11 $278.00 $420.00 $4,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
 

Polyethylene Corrugated Drainage Pipe 
 Core & Main, LP Chemung Supply Corp. Garrett Industrial Supply Cox Piping Supply Geo Ternent Sons 

Size Type Couplings Flared End Type Couplings Flared End Type Couplings Flared End Type Couplings Flared Ends Type Couplings Flared Ends 
 Smooth 

Interior 
 Sections Smooth 

Interior 
 Sections Smooth 

Interior 
 Sections Smooth 

Interior 
     

Diameter $/FT   $/FT   $/Ft   $/Ft      
12” $7.35 N/A $170.50 $6.98 Included $161.97 $8.73 N/A $231.39 $7.51 $13.02 $179.96 $15.95 No Bid No Bid 

15” $11.29 N/A $170.50 $10.72 Included $161.97 $13.40 N/A $231.39 $11.53 $21.69 $179.96 $22.95 No Bid No Bid 

18” $12.04 N/A $229.04 $11.43 Included $217.58 $15.24 N/A $310.83 $12.29 $36.97 $241.75 $27.95 No Bid No Bid 

24” $18.65 N/A $293.93 $17.71 Included $279.23 $23.61 N/A $398.90 $19.04 $52.12 $310.25 $43.29 No Bid No Bid 

30” $37.93 N/A $529.69 $36.03 Included $503.20 No Bid N/A No Bid $38.74 $121.78 $559.11 $65.95 No Bid No Bid 

36” $46.46 N/A $853.83 $44.13 Included $811.13 $55.16 N/A $1,158.76 $47.45 $168.61 $901.25 $82.29 No Bid No Bid 

42” $61.38 N/A $1,610.38 $58.31 Included $1,529.86 N/A N/A N/A $62.70 $246.79 $1,699.84 $105.95 No Bid No Bid 

48” $79.50 N/A $1,874.09 $75.52 Included $1,780.38 $94.40 N/A $2,543.40 $81.20 $289.71 $1,978.20 $129.95 No Bid No Bid 

60” $118.40 N/A $3,331.61 $112.48 Included $3,165.02 $140.60 N/A $4,521.46 $120.95 $450.67 $3,516.69 $190.95 No Bid No Bid 

Bid is for in-line bell type pipe Yes  Yes No No 

 



 
 
 
 
 

Aluminized  Drainage Pipe  
  Core & Main, LP Chemung Supply Corp. Garrett Industrial Supply Cox Piping Supply Geo Ternent Sons 

Description Gage Cost per 
Ft. 

Bands Flared 
End 

Cost per 
Ft. 

Bands Flared 
End 

Cost per 
Ft. 

Bands Flared 
End 

Cost per 
Ft. 

Bands Flared 
End 

Cost per 
Ft. 

Bands Flared end 

12” 16 $19.74 $40.93 $120.06 $21.00 $45.00 $128.00 $23.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.95 No Bid No Bid 

15” 16 $24.95 $44.58 $129.82 $26.50 $47.00 $138.00 $29.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.95 No Bid No Bid 

18” 16 $29.62 $47.90 $186.61 $31.50 $50.00 $198.00 $34.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid $61.95 No Bid No Bid 

24” 16 $39.50 $54.13 $297.39 $42.00 $58.00 $315.00 $45.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid $79.95 No Bid No Bid 

36” 14 $72.01 $69.79 $959.98 $76.00 $76.00 $1,100.00 $84.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

72” 12 $191.64 $320.70 $3,245.11 $202.00 $338.00 $3,444.00 $248.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 


