
 
Motor Oil and Grease  

Bid #22-0512 Bid Tabulation 
 

 Oakland Oil & 
Propane 

PetroChoice, LLC PPC Lubricants, LLC 

5W-30 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 Medallion Plus SB 5W30 

SN GF-6 

Duramax SB 5W-30 

Quart $3.55 $2.81 $4.52 

10W-30 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 Medallion Plus SB 

10W30 SN GF-6 

Duramax SB 10W-30 

55 Gallon Drum $635.00 $571.11 $548.35 

Quart $3.55 $3.21 $4.50 

15W-40 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Shell T-2 Dynaplex 21C Dezol 

15W40 CK-4 

Drydene Diesel All 15W-

40 

Gallon $12.55 $11.79 $11.22 

5 Gallon Pail $80.00 $68.90 $67.10 

Quart $4.45 No Bid $5.56 

85W-140 Gear Lubricant  
Brand Name 

Starfire GL-5 Dynaplex 21C Rigel 

85W-140 

Drydene Gear All 85W-

140 

Gallon $21.85 $12.68 $12.83 

120 LB. Keg $320.00 $236.28 $250.24 

Multipurpose Tractor Fluid 
Brand Name 

Coastal Dynaplex 21C Trac Gard Drydene Transall Tractor 

Fluid 

Gallon $10.45 $10.27 $9.99 

5 Gallon Pail $62.00 $60.10 $60.95 

Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 
Heavy Duty Engine Oil       
Brand Name 

Shell Rotella T-4 Dynaplex 21C SHPD 

15W40 

Shell Rotella CJ-4 

Gallon $17.73 $11.99 $13.62 

5 Gallon Pail $100.34 $69.30 $78.85 

Transmission Fluid 
Brand Name 

Coastal DEX Merc Dynaplex TO-4 30W Drydene Transall TD 

TO-4 30W 

55 Gallon Drum $580.00 $794.65 $683.10 

5 Gallon Pail $59.53 $82.90 $68.35 

Quart $3.75 No Bid $3.42* 

Multipurpose Lithium 
Complex Grease 
 Brand Name 

Starfire HD Hi Temp 

Red EP2 

Dynaplex Hi Tac #2 Drydene Retraplex Ruby 

Red Plus EP2 

120 LB. Keg $440.00 $638.80 $376.80 

Tube $4.52 $42.61 $5.06 

10W-40 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 Mobil Special 10W40 Duramax SB 10W-40 

Quart 
 

$3.55 $5.14 $4.52 

    



 
80W-90 High Performance 
Gear Oil            Brand Name 

Starfire GL-5 Dynaplex 21C Galaxy 
700 80W90 

Drydene Gearall 80W-90 

Gallon $21.85 $11.77 $11.67 

55 Gallon Drum $905.00 $864.00 $702.90 

Bottle (32 oz.) $5.60 No Bid $5.23 

Power Steering Fluid 
Brand Name 

Berkebile 2+2 Valvoline VPS Power 

Steering Fluid 

Mag 1 

Quart $3.50 $8.06 $4.39 

5W-20 Synthetic Blend GF-5 
Motor Oil         Brand Name 

Coastal Medallion Plus SB 5W20 Duramax SB 5W-20 

55 Gallon Drum $635.00 $551.10 $551.65 
1 Gallon Pail $5.28 No Bid $57.15* 
Quart $4.00 $3.13 $4.52 
5W-30 Synthetic Blend GF-5 
Motor Oil         Brand Name 

Coastal Medallion Plus SB 5W30 Duramax SB 5W-30 

55 Gallon Drum $635.00 $571.11 $551.65 
1 Gallon Pail $5.28 $11.24 $57.15* 
Quart $4.00 $2.81 $4.52 
80W-140 Synthetic Gear 
Brand Name 
 

Starfire GL-5 Dynaplex 21C Synzol 
80W140 

Shell Spirax S6 AXME 
80W-140 

120 LB. Keg $450.00 $654.20 $516.64 
CD-50 Synthetic Gear 
Brand Name 

Starfire Dynaplex 21C Synzol 50 Drydene Transall Syn 

50W 

120 LB. Keg $460.00 $598.08 $480.16 

Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) 
Brand Name 

Berkebile 2+2 Dynaplex DEF Drydene DieselAll DEF 

Gallon  $2.75 $3.95 $3.13 

1 Gallon Bottle $24.50* $5.70 $14.13* 
 *Different Quantity Bid 
 




