
Invitation to Bid #22-0512F Fuel

A B C D E A B C D E

Low Obtainable 

Altoona OPIS Rack Price 

05-05-2022

Markup (4 Decimal 

Places) Bid Price A+B

Estimate 

Quantity 

(Gallons) Total C X D

Low Obtainable 

Altoona OPIS Rack 

Price 05-05-2022

Markup (4 Decimal 

Places) Bid Price A+B

Estimate Quantity 

(Gallons) Total C X D

Tank Wagon Deliveries

Fuel Type

Unleaded Gasoline $3.4265 $0.2000 $3.6265 7,600 $27,561.40 No Bid $1.0000 7,600 $0.00

On Road Diesel Fuel $4.2912 $0.2000 $4.4912 1,000 $4,491.20 No Bid $1.0000 1,000 $0.00

Off Road Diesel Fuel $4.2962 $0.2000 $4.4962 41,659 $187,307.20 No Bid $1.0000 41,659 $0.00

Heating Oil $4.7325 $0.2000 $4.9325 107,300 $529,257.25 No Bid $1.0000 107,300 $0.00

Kerosene $5.1345 $0.2000 $5.3345 18,900 $100,822.05 No Bid $1.0000 18,900 $0.00

Total $849,439.10 $0.00

Low Obtainable 

Altoona OPIS Rack Price 

05-05-2022

Markup (4 Decimal 

Places) Bid Price A+B

Estimate 

Quantity 

(Gallons) Total C X D

Low Obtainable 

Altoona OPIS Rack 

Price 05-05-2022

Markup (4 Decimal 

Places) Bid Price A+B

Estimate Quantity 

(Gallons) Total C X D

Transport Deliveries

Fuel Type

Unleaded Gasoline $3.4265 $0.0950 $3.5215 177,851 $626,302.30 $3.5457 $0.0602 $3.6059 177,851 $641,312.9209

On Road Diesel Fuel $4.2912 $0.0950 $4.3862 146,500 $642,578.30 $4.7192 $0.1305 $4.8497 146,500 $710,481.0500

Heating Oil $4.7325 $0.1000 $4.8325 62,000 $299,615.00 $5.0523 $0.1990 $5.2513 62,000 $325,580.6000

Kerosene $5.1345 $0.1000 $5.2345 1,000 $5,234.50 No Bid No Bid

Total $1,573,730.10 $1,677,374.5709

Oakland Oil & Propane Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.

Oakland Oil & Propane Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.



Invitation to Bid #22-0512F Fuel

A B C D E

Low Obtainable 

Altoona OPIS Rack 

Price 05-05-2022

Markup (4 Decimal 

Places) Bid Price A+B

Estimate Quantity 

(Gallons) Total C X D

No Bid 7,600 $0.00

No Bid 1,000 $0.00

No Bid 41,659 $0.00

No Bid 107,300 $0.00

No Bid 18,900 $0.00

$0.00

Low Obtainable 

Altoona OPIS Rack 

Price 05-05-2022

Markup (4 Decimal 

Places) Bid Price A+B

Estimate Quantity 

(Gallons) Total C X D

$3.4265 $0.0723 $3.4988 177,851 $622,265.08

$4.2912 $0.1009 $4.3921 146,500 $643,442.65

$4.7325 $0.0786 $4.8111 62,000 $298,288.20

$5.1345 $0.1209 $5.2554 1,000 $5,255.40

$1,569,251.33

Petroleum Traders Corporation

Petroleum Traders Corporation




