Maple Street Low Pressure Wastewater System Extention

Bid #12-0906 Bid Tabulation

Alternative 1 - Open Cut Winters Landmark Excavating Frank Arnold Excavating Associates Green River Group
Item
No. |Description Quantity [Unit |Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 [CR-6 Fill Material 150 CY $25.00 $3,750.00 $40.00 $6,000.00 $24.00 $3,600.00 $35.00 $5,250.00 $44.40 $6,660.00 No Bid No Bid
Flowable Fill Material 75 CY $150.00 $11,250.00 $125.00 $9,375.00 $110.00 $8,250.00 $105.00 $7,875.00 $202.40 $15,180.00 No Bid No Bid
Preconstruction Photos or
3 |Video 1 LS $1,650.00 $1,650.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,811.00 $1,811.00 No Bid No Bid
4 |Mobilization 1 LS $7,650.00 $7,650.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,654.00 $8,654.00 No Bid No Bid
Erosion & Sediment
5 |Control Devices 1 LS $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,443.00 $7,443.00 No Bid No Bid
Maintenance & Protection
6 |of Traffic 1 LS $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,032.00 $5,032.00 No Bid No Bid
Paved Municipal Road
7 |Restoration 220 LF $40.00 $8,800.00 $50.00 $11,000.00 $27.00 $5,940.00 $70.00 $15,400.00 $36.90 $8,118.00 No Bid No Bid
Paved Driveway
8 [Restoration 100 LF $40.00 $4,000.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $24.00 $2,400.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 $50.45 $5,045.00 No Bid No Bid
Mun. Shoulder/Stabilized
9 |Driveway Rest 600 LF $5.00 $3,000.00 $10.00 $6,000.00 $3.00 $1,800.00 $16.00 $9,600.00 $5.44 $3,264.00 No Bid No Bid
In-Line Flushing
10 |Connection 2 EA | $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,200.00 $6,400.00 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 $1,939.00 $3,878.00 No Bid No Bid
Terminal Flushing
11 |Connection 1 EA | $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $1,450.00 $1,450.00 $1,793.00 $1,793.00 No Bid No Bid
12 |Sewage Gate Valve 5 EA $400.00 $2,000.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $900.00 $4,500.00 $750.00 $3,750.00 $726.00 $3,630.00 No Bid No Bid
Precast Concrete Manhole
In-Line Flushing
Connection w/Sewage
13 |Air Release 1 EA | $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $9,400.00 $9,400.00 $10,474.00 $10,474.00 No Bid No Bid
In-Line Flushing
Connection w/Sewage
14 |Air Release 1 EA $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $9,400.00 $9,400.00 $10,019.00 $10,019.00 No Bid No Bid
15 |2" Pressure Main 2650 LF $33.00 $87,450.00 $25.00 $66,250.00 $26.00 $68,900.00 $22.00 $58,300.00 $19.10 $50,615.00 No Bid No Bid
16 |11/2" Pressure Lateral 900 LF $22.00 $19,800.00 $25.00 $22,500.00 $18.00 $16,200.00 $18.50 $16,650.00 $26.35 $23,715.00 No Bid No Bid
17 |4" Casing Road Bore 300 LF $20.00 $6,000.00 $30.00 $9,000.00 $35.00 $10,500.00 $104.84 $31,452.00 No Bid No Bid
18 |4" Casing (Open Cut) 150 LS $30.00 $4,500.00 $15.00 $2,250.00 $35.00 $5,250.00 $43.90 $6,585.00 No Bid No Bid
19 |Stream Crossing #1 1 LF | $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $8,053.00 $8,053.00 No Bid No Bid
20 |Seeding & Mulching 3350 LF $5.00 $16,750.00 $2.00 $6,700.00 $3.00 $10,050.00 $2.00 $6,700.00 $2.30 $7,705.00 No Bid No Bid
21 |Concrete Encasement 10 LF $125.00 $1,250.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $110.00 $1,100.00 $150.00 $1,500.00 $59.50 $595.00 No Bid No Bid
Simplex Ginder Pump
22 |Installation 9 EA | $2,000.00 $18,000.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,200.00 $28,800.00 $3,000.00 $27,000.00 $3,094.00 $27,846.00 No Bid No Bid
Duplex Grinder Pump
23 |Installation 1 EA | $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,555.00 $3,555.00 No Bid No Bid
Pressure Sewer
24 |Connection 10 EA $600.00 $6,000.00 $300.00 $3,000.00 $900.00 $9,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $1,523.00 $15,230.00 No Bid No Bid
Total $230,850.00 $204,325.00 $217,890.00 $247,825.00 $266,352.00 No Bid




Alternative 2 - Directional Drilling Winters Landmark Excavating Frank Arnold Excavating Associates Green River Group

Item

No. |Description Quantity [Unit | Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1  [CR-6 Fill Material 60 CY $25.00 $1,500.00 $50.00 $3,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $4,500.00
Flowable Fill Material 75 CY $150.00 $11,250.00 $110.00 $8,250.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $300.00 $22,500.00
Preconstruction Photos or

3 |Video 1 LS $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,000.00 $3,000.00

4  |Mobilization 1 LS $7,050.00 $7,050.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,000.00 $22,000.00
Erosion & Sediment

5  |Control Devices 1 LS $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16,000.00 $16,000.00
Maintenance & Protection

6  |of Traffic 1 LS $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16,000.00 $16,000.00
Paved Municipal Road

7  |Restoration 220 LF $40.00 $8,800.00 $30.00 $6,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $120.00 $26,400.00
Mun. Shoulder/Stabilized

8  |Driveway Rest 100 LF $5.00 $500.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 $5,000.00
In-Line Flushing

9  [Connection 2 EA | $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,200.00 $6,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,000.00 $6,000.00
Terminal Flushing

10 [Connection 1 EA | $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,000.00 $3,000.00

11 [Sewage Gate Valve 5 EA $400.00 $2,000.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $1,100.00 $5,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,300.00 $6,500.00
Precast Concrete Manhole
In-Line Flushing
Connection W/Sewage

12 | Air Release 1 EA | $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,000.00 $11,000.00
In-Line Flushing
Connection w/Sewage

13 | Air Release 1 EA $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,000.00 $10,000.00

14 [2" Pressure Main 2650 LF $20.00 $53,000.00 $15.00 $39,750.00 $22.70 $60,155.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $66,250.00

15 [11/2" Pressure Lateral 900 LF $18.00 $16,200.00 $15.00 $13,500.00 $18.00 $16,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $22,500.00

16 |4 " Casing Road Bore 300 LF $15.00 $4,500.00 $24.00 $7,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 $27,000.00

17 [4" Casing (Open Cut) 150 LF $40.00 $6,000.00 $10.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 $12,000.00

18 |Stream Crossing #1 1 LS $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25,000.00 $25,000.00

19 [Seeding & Mulching 1000 LF $5.00 $5,000.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5,000.00
Simplex Ginder Pump

20 |Installation 9 EA | $2,000.00 $18,000.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,200.00 $28,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,500.00 $31,500.00
Duplex Grinder Pump

21 |Installation 1 EA | $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,500.00 $6,500.00
Pressure Sewer

22 |Connection 10 EA $600.00 $6,000.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $900.00 $9,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,000.00 $20,000.00

Total $154,500.00 $175,600.00 $177,955.00 No Bid No Bid $367,650.00




