
Custodial Cleaning & Paper Products 
Bid #12-0517CC Bid Tabulation 

 

Item # 
 

Calico Naylors Janitors 
Supply 

A. F. 
Wendling 

All 
American 

Poly 

Interboro 
Packaging 

Corp 

Pyramid 
School 

Products 

Mark IV Central 
Poly Corp 

P1  Toilet Tissue 33.58 No Bid 29.93 33.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.47 43.66 
P2  Hand Towels 17.28 No Bid 19.25 21.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.88 19.66 
P3  Roll Towels 20.64 No Bid 20.15 21.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.95 No Bid 
P4  Facial Tissue 17.88 18.96 19.95 18.95 No Bid No Bid 19.98 41.08 26.70 
P5  8 oz. Foam Cups No Bid 19.25 18.92 18.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.80 No Bid 
P6  12 oz. Foam Cups No Bid 31.00 25.94 25.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.24 No Bid 
P7  Toilet Seat Covers 28.24 9.32 14.98 31.70 No Bid No Bid 16.99 9.44 No Bid 
P8  Natural Roll Towels 19.24 30.00 34.98 33.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.31 24.66 
P9  Toilet Tissue No Bid 33.99 29.95 27.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.00 28.66 
L1  24 x 24 Trash Liners  11.98 No Bid 19.97 21.05 15.89 14.48 No Bid 11.20 17.93 
L2  30 x 36 Trash Liners 13.28 No Bid 13.98 32.50 14.89 15.32 No Bid 26.76 16.66 
L3  38 x 58 Trash Liners 1.5 mil 17.84 No Bid 21.75 19.95 15.85 17.84 No Bid 54.76 21.80 
L4  38 x 58 Trash Liners 2.4 mil 21.54 No Bid 30.97 No Bid 21.14 24.82 No Bid 60.86 34.80 
C1  SparCling Toilet Bowl Cleaner No Bid No Bid 24.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
C2  Lemon Pine Sol No Bid 26.10 26.98 30.50 No Bid No Bid 29.98 24.07 No Bid 
C3  Kimberly Clark Liquid Soap No Bid 31.68 30.98 *35.10 No Bid No Bid 30.98 29.53 No Bid 
C4  Windex Glass Cleaner No Bid 46.50 45.98 47.05 No Bid No Bid 48.15 41.45 No Bid 
C5  Orange Glo Wood Clnr/Polish No Bid 25.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
C6  Spic N Span All Purpose Spray No Bid 42.48 40.97 37.88 No Bid No Bid 40.98 37.63 No Bid 
C7  Swell Stainless Steel Cleaner No Bid No Bid 54.98 *49.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
C8  Chlorine Bleach 9.48 No Bid 9.96 9.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.81 No Bid 
C9  Liquid Antibacterial Hand Soap 25.88 47.00 25.76 54.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 41.51 No Bid 
C10  Carpet Cleaning Solution 26.78 45.00 29.90 61.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
C11  50 lb. Laundry Detergent 23.54 No Bid 23.90 34.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.75 No Bid 
C12  Max Clean Degreaser 33.78 No Bid 35.90 33.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.68 No Bid 
C13  Dishwasher DeLimer No Bid No Bid 35.98 69.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
C14  Dishwasher Detergent No Bid No Bid 34.98 59.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.25 No Bid 
C15  Magic Eraser No Bid 26.15 29.98 26.04 No Bid No Bid 24.98 3.68 No Bid 



Item # 
 

Calico Naylors Janitors 
Supply 

A. F. 
Wendling 

All 
American 

Poly 

Interboro 
Packaging 

Corporation

Pyramid 
School 

Products 

Mark IV Central 
Poly Corp 

C16  Swiffer Duster Refill No Bid 47.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 51.98 7.56 No Bid 
C17  Swiffer Duster Kit No Bid 4.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
C18  Foamy Hand Soap  33.54 No Bid 47.90 54.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
C19  Foamy Hand Wash & Sanitizer No Bid No Bid 68.97 79.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
M1  Urinal Screens 11.18 No Bid 12.98 24.05 No Bid No Bid 10.98 17.15 No Bid 
M2  SprayPak Spray Disinfectant No Bid No Bid No Bid *41.15 No Bid No Bid 22.69 No Bid No Bid 
M3 “ Y” Vacuum Bags No Bid 4.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.11 No Bid 
M4  Super Coach Vacuum Bags No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
M5  Advance Carpetwin Vac Bags No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
M6  Flying Insect Spray 38.64 No Bid No Bid 89.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
M7  Wasp & Hornet Spray 40.68 56.45 No Bid 72.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.26 No Bid 
M8  Metal Polish No Bid 28.56 No Bid 59.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.08 No Bid 
M9  Dust Mask 8.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
M10  Drain Opener 29.54 54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
M11  Sanitary Napkin Bags 12.14 18.65 28.90 46.75 No Bid No Bid 13.99 No Bid No Bid 
M12  Baby Wipes No Bid 29.10 39.98 37.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.31 No Bid 
M13  Ant Trap Discs No Bid 1.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
M14 Super Coach Vac Electric Cord No Bid No Bid 24.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
M15  Instant Hand Sanitizer 35.98 46.32 29.99 50.10 No Bid No Bid 44.98 40.03 No Bid 
M16  Purell Hand Sanitizer Refill No Bid 73.00 58.94 *39.90 No Bid No Bid 76.95 67.42 No Bid 
F1  Looped Cotton Mop Head 20 oz 45.68 No Bid 39.94 4.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid 77.77 No Bid 
F2  Looped Cotton Mop Head 24 oz 45.68 60.95 49.92 4.69 No Bid No Bid 50.28 5.41 No Bid 
F3  Rayon Mop Head 20 oz 36.98 74.95 49.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.08 3.53 No Bid 
F4  36” Dust Mop Head 4.78 11.49 7.98 49.18 No Bid No Bid 35.94 9.47 No Bid 
F5  36” Dust Mop Handle 4.34 10.45 7.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.88 8.28 No Bid 
F6  36” Dust Mop Frame 2.58 4.95 4.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.99 3.97 No Bid 
F7  Latch Type Mop Handle 6.94 7.08 11.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.99 9.86 No Bid 
F8  42” Upright Broom No Bid No Bid 7.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.99 4.70 No Bid 
F9  24” Street Broom No Bid 11.99 16.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.99 9.21 No Bid 
F10  24” Floor Broom No Bid 11.99 14.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.99 No Bid No Bid 
F11  30” Floor Broom No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.99 No Bid No Bid 
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F12  24” Nylon Angle Broom No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
F13  17” Black Floor Pads 12.34 No Bid 14.98 23.15 No Bid No Bid 8.99 No Bid No Bid 
F14  17” Red Floor Pads  12.34 No Bid 14.98 26.10 No Bid No Bid 8.99 No Bid No Bid 
F15  18” Black Floor Pads 13.28 16.89 15.94 23.15 No Bid No Bid 9.99 No Bid No Bid 
F16  18” Red Floor Pads 13.28 15.64 15.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.99 No Bid No Bid 
F17  Wax Stripper 41.68 No Bid 49.85 79.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
F18  Prime Shine Floor Finish No Bid No Bid 46.98 *65.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
F19  Floor Restorer No Bid No Bid 59.95 66.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
F20  Mop Bucket & Wringer 72.34 99.89 69.95 69.50 No Bid No Bid 63.98 99.58 No Bid 
F21  Doodle Bug Handle & Base 4.79 9.06 16.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.98 No Bid No Bid 
F22  Doodle Bug Pads 15.58 129.00 29.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 89.97 No Bid No Bid 
G1  Food Handling Gloves – Large 4.88 No Bid 99.99 28.65 No Bid No Bid 5.99 5.55 No Bid 
G2  Exam Gloves – Small 6.98 No Bid 7.95 6.05 No Bid 5.50 5.89 7.35 No Bid 
G3  Exam Gloves – Medium 6.98 No Bid 7.95 6.05 No Bid 5.50 5.89 7.35 No Bid 
G4  Exam Gloves – Large 6.98 No Bid 7.95 6.05 No Bid 5.50 5.89 7.35 No Bid 
G5  Exam Gloves – X-Large 6.98 No Bid 6.95 6.05 No Bid 5.50 5.89 7.35 No Bid 
G6  Nitrile Xtra Exam Gloves 6.74 18.50 7.99 6.15 No Bid No Bid 5.85 10.64 No Bid 
G7  Nitrile Exam Gloves – X-Large 6.14 6.50 No Bid 6.15 No Bid No Bid 5.85 7.41 No Bid 
G8  Nitrile Exam Gloves – Large 6.14 6.50 7.99 6.15 No Bid No Bid 5.85 7.41 No Bid 
G9  Nitrile Exam Gloves – Medium 6.14 6.50 No Bid 6.15 No Bid No Bid 5.85 7.41 No Bid 
G10  Nitrile Exam Gloves – Small 6.14 6.50 No Bid 6.15 No Bid No Bid 5.85 7.41 No Bid 
G11  Nitrile HR Gloves – Large No Bid 10.99 No Bid 9.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
G12  Nitrile HR Gloves – X-Large No Bid 10.99 No Bid 9.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
G13  Synthetic Vinyl Gloves - Med 2.98 No Bid 6.89 4.125 No Bid No Bid 3.49 4.44 No Bid 
Minimum Order 200.00 1.00 None 350.00 500.00 0 50.00 0 100.00 
Delivery Schedule 14 Days 

ARO 
Mon - Fri Every other 

Tuesday 
Friday - 
Weekly 

5 - 15 5 – 7 Days 
ARO 

7 – 10 Days 
ARO 

Daily Mon - Fri 
8 Am – 3 PM 

       Notes:    
       
         *Substitutes on ONLY products  


