Location # 1 Town of Accident

Beitzel Corporation

Standby and Mobile Generators
Bid #15-0813 Bid Tabulations

R.C. Newman, LLC

A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc.

Dynamic Construction

Bid Price $40,050.00 No Bid No Bid $69,115.00
Options:

Convenience Receptacles Included No Bid No Bid Standard
Cold Weather Package $405.00 No Bid No Bid $335.00
Single Axle Trailer with Electric Brakes and

Spare Tire $1,815.00 No Bid No Bid $1,500.00
Spark Arrestor $92.00 No Bid No Bid $75.00
Contract Completion Calendar Days 90 Days No Bid No Bid 90 Days
Make & Model of Generator Generac Magnum MMG451F4 No Bid No Bid Generac Magnum MMG45IF4
Generators Warranty 2 Years/2000 Hours No Bid No Bid 2 Years/2000 Hours
Make & Model of Transfer Switch N/A No Bid No Bid N/A
Transfer Switch Warranty N/A No Bid No Bid N/A

Location #2 Garrett County Community
Action Committee, Inc.

Beitzel Corporation

R.C. Newman, LLC

A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc.

Dynamic Construction

Generator Options:

Natural Gas Generator Bid Price $125,350.00 No Bid No Bid $186,000.00
Options:

Starting Battery $435.00 No Bid No Bid $360.00
Battery Heating Pad $145.00 No Bid No Bid $120.00
Coolant Heater Included No Bid No Bid Standard
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days No Bid No Bid 120 Days
Make & Model of Generator Generac SG0250GG20129N18HPYYE No Bid No Bid Generac SG0250GG20129N18HPYYE
Generator Warranty 2 Years No Bid No Bid 2 Years
Diesel Generator Bid Price $79,275.00 No Bid No Bid $127,200.00
Options:

Starting Battery $305.00 No Bid $250.00
Battery Heating Pad $92.00 No Bid $75.00




Beitzel Corporation

Standby and Mobile Generators
Bid #15-0813 Bid Tabulations

R.C. Newman, LLC

A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc.

Dynamic Construction

Coolant Heater Included No Bid No Bid Standard
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days No Bid No Bid 120 Days

Make & Model of Generator Generac SD0250GG1787D18HPYY2 No Bid No Bid Generac SD0250GG1787D18HPYY2
Generator Warranty 2 Years No Bid No Bid 2 Years
Transfer Switch Options:

Automatic Indoor Bid Price $17,700.00 No Bid No Bid $19,564.00

Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac PSTS1200 NEMA 1 No Bid No Bid Generac PSTS1200 NEMA 1
Transfer Switch Warranty 2 Years No Bid No Bid 2 Years
Automatic Outdoor Bid Price $20,995.00 No Bid No Bid $23,249.00

Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac PSTS1200 NEMA 3R No Bid No Bid Generac PSTS1200 NEMA 3R
Transfer Switch Warranty 2 Years No Bid No Bid 2 Years

Location #3 Grantsville Volunteer Fire

Department Beitzel Corporation R.C. Newman, LLC A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc. Dynamic Construction
Bid Price $117,570.00 No Bid No Bid $177,950.00
Options:

Starting Battery $435.00 No Bid No Bid $360.00

Battery Heating Pad $145.00 No Bid No Bid $120.00
Coolant Heater Included No Bid No Bid Standard

Bid Price Concrete Pad Only $2,520.00 No Bid No Bid $12,000.00
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days No Bid No Bid 120 Days

Make & Model of Generator Generac SG0200GG20129N18HPLYE No Bid No Bid Generac SG0200GG20129N18HPLYE
Generator Warranty 2 Years No Bid No Bid 2 Years

Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac GTS080N No Bid No Bid Generac GTSO080N
Transfer Switch Warranty 2 Years No Bid No Bid 2 Years

Make & Model of Annunciator Generac 5465 (0054650) No Bid No Bid Generac 5465 (0054650)
Annunciator Warranty 2 Years No Bid No Bid 2 Years




Location #4 Friendsville Fire Department

Beitzel Corporation

R.C. Newman, LLC

Standby and Mobile Generators
Bid #15-0813 Bid Tabulations

A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc.

Dynamic Construction

Bid Price $42,650.00 No Bid No Bid $89,800.00
Options:

Monitoring Service $1,235.00 No Bid No Bid $1,235.00
Sound Attenuating Housing (Level 1) Included No Bid No Bid Standard
Starting Battery $105.00 No Bid No Bid $85.00
Battery Heating Pad $182.00 No Bid No Bid $150.00
Coolant Heater Included No Bid No Bid Standard
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days No Bid No Bid 60 Days
Make & Model of Generator Generac SGG0080JG188.0V18HBSYA No Bid No Bid Generac SG0080JG1880V18HBSYA
Generator Warranty 2 Years No Bid No Bid 2 Years
Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac GTS040W No Bid No Bid Generac GTS040W
Transfer Switch Warranty 2 Years No Bid No Bid 2 Years

Location #5 Town of Loch Lynn Heights

Beitzel Corporation

R.C. Newman, LLC

A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc.

Dynamic Construction

Bid Price $29,150.00 No Bid $16,028.27 Battery Not Included $63,500.00
Options:

26R Wet Cell Battery $78.00 No Bid $129.99 $65.00
Battery Make/Model Generac 5819-26R No Bid Diehard/26R Generac 5819-26R
Cold Weather Kit $272.00 No Bid $429.99 $225.00
Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6212 No Bid Generac/56350 Generac 6212
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days No Bid 5 Days 60 Days
Make & Model of Generator Generac 6729 No Bid Generac/ 6729 Generac 6729
Generator Warranty 5 Years No Bid 5 Yr Limited 5 Years
Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac RTST200A3 No Bid RTST200A3/Generac Generac RTST200A3
Transfer Switch Warranty 5 Years No Bid 5 Yr Limited 5 Years




Location #6 Town of Grantsville

Beitzel Corporation

Standby and Mobile Generators
Bid #15-0813 Bid Tabulations

R.C. Newman, LLC

A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc.

Dynamic Construction

Bid Price $41,045.00 No Bid No Bid $68,225.00
Options:

In-Line Engine Block Heater $194.00 No Bid No Bid $160.00

2A Trickle Battery Charger $98.00 No Bid No Bid $80.00

Single Axle Trailer with Electric Brakes $1,550.00 No Bid No Bid $1,275.00

350 Gallon Fuel Tank $6,995.00 No Bid No Bid $5,100.00
Contract Completion Calendar Days 90 Days No Bid No Bid 90 Days
Make & Model of Generator Generac Magnum MMG451F4 No Bid No Bid Generac Magnum MMG451F4
Generator Warranty 2 Years/2000 Hours No Bid No Bid 2 Years/2000 Hours
Make & Model of Transfer Switch Midwest Electric GS3262B25UL No Bid No Bid N/A
Transfer Switch Warranty 1 Year No Bid No Bid N/A

Location #7 Meadows East Senior Housing
Unit

Beitzel Corporation

R.C. Newman, LLC

A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc.

Dynamic Construction

Bid Price $46,420.00 $41,586.00 $28,710.36 $103,300.00
Options:

Cold Weather Kit $275.00 $272.25 No Bid Wrong Bid Form $225.00
Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6175 Generac 6175 No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6175
Extreme Cold Weather Kit $255.00 $255.00 No Bid Wrong Bid Form $210.00
Extreme Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6174 Generac 6174 No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6174
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days 90 Days 6 Days 60 Days
Make & Model of Generator Generac QT02515ANSX Generac QT02515ANSX Generac/QT02515 Generac QT02515ANSX
Generator Warranty 5 Years 5 Years 2 Yr Limited 5 Years
Make & Model of Transfer Switch RTSP200A3 RTSP200A3 Generac Generac/RTST200A3 RTSP200A3
Transfer Switch Warranty 5 Years 5 Years 5 Yr Limited 5 Years




Location #8 Meadow Woods East Senior

Standby and Mobile Generators
Bid #15-0813 Bid Tabulations

Housing Unit Beitzel Corporation R.C. Newman, LLC A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc. Dynamic Construction
Bid Price $39,275.00 $41,704.00 $28,744.86 $102,275.00
Options:

Cold Weather Kit $275.00 $272.25 No Bid Wrong Bid Form $225.00

Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6175 Generac 6175 No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6175
Extreme Cold Weather Kit $255.00 $255.00 No Bid Wrong Bid Form $210.00
Extreme Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6174 Generac 6174 No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6174
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days 90 Days 6 Days 90 Days

Make & Model of Generator Generac QT02515ANSX Generac QT02515ANSX Generac/QT02515 Generac QT02515ANSX
Generator Warranty 5 Years 5 Years 2 Yr Limited 5 Years

Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac RTSP200A3 Generac RTSP200A3 Generac/RTST200A3 Generac RTSP200A3
Transfer Switch Warranty 5 Years 5 Years 5 Yr Limited 5 Years

Location #9 Oakwood East Senior Housing
Unit

Beitzel Corporation

R.C. Newman, LLC

A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc.

Dynamic Construction

Bid Price $40,480.00 $41,364.00 $28,581.96 $101,100.00
Options:

Cold Weather Kid $275.00 $272.25 No Bid Wrong Bid Form $225.00

Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6175 Generac 6175 No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6175
Extreme Cold Weather Kit $255.00 $255.00 No Bid Wrong Bid Form $210.00
Extreme Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6174 Generac 6174 No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6174
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days 90 Days 6 Days 60 Days

Make & Model of Generator Generac QT02515ANSX Generac QT02515ANSX Generac/QT02515 Generac QT02515ANSX
Generators Warranty 5 Years 5 Years 2 Yr Limited 5 Years

Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac RTSP200A3 Generac RTSP200A3 Generac/RTST200A3 Generac RTSP200A3
Transfer Switch Warranty 5 Years 5 Years 5 Yr Limited 5 Years




Location #10 Underwood South Senior

Standby and Mobile Generators
Bid #15-0813 Bid Tabulations

Housing Unit Beitzel Corporation R.C. Newman, LLC A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc. Dynamic Construction
Bid Price $40,980.00 $41,368.00 $28,640.06 $101,800.00
Options:

Cold Weather Kid $275.00 $272.25 No Bid Wrong Bid Form $225.00

Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6175 Generac 6175 No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6175
Extreme Cold Weather Kit $255.00 $255.00 No Bid Wrong Bid Form $210.00
Extreme Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6174 Generac 6174 No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6174
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days 90 Days 6 Days 60 Days

Make & Model of Generator Generac QT02515ANSX Generac QT02515ANSX Generac/QT02515 Generac QT02515ANSX
Generators Warranty 5 Years 5 Years 2 Yr Limited 5 Years

Make & Model of Transfer Switch Genarac RTSP200A3 Genarac RTSP200A3 Generac/RTST200A3 Generac RTSP200A3
Transfer Switch Warranty 5 Years 5 Years 5 Yr Limited 5 Years

Location #11 Yough West Senior Housing
Unit

Beitzel Corporation

R.C. Newman, LLC

A.D. Naylors & Co., Inc.

Dynamic Construction

Bid Price $45,345.00 No Bid $28,763.86 $89,200.00
Options:

Cold Weather Kid $275.00 No Bid No Bid Wrong Bid Form $225.00

Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6175 No Bid No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6175
Extreme Cold Weather Kit $255.00 No Bid No Bid Wrong Bid Form $210.00
Extreme Cold Weather Kit Make/Model Generac 6174 No Bid No Bid Wrong Bid Form Generac 6174
Contract Completion Calendar Days 120 Days No Bid 6 Days 60 Days
Make & Model of Generator Generac QT03015]NSX No Bid Generac/QT02515 Generac QT03015]NSX
Generators Warranty 5 Years No Bid 2 Yr Limited 5 Years

Make & Model of Transfer Switch Generac RTSN400]3 No Bid Generac/RTST200A3 Generac RTSN400]3
Transfer Switch Warranty 5 Years No Bid 5 Yr Limited 5 Years

Notes: The bid from A.D. Naylors is considered nonresponsive because the required Bid Bond was not provided and the incorrect bid forms were used.




