
Winter Abrasives Bid #12-0920WA 
Bid Tabulation

Mileage Round Trip Hauling Cost

Location Type 1 & 2
Type 1 A 
Washed

Type 1 B 
Unwashed Type 2 Per Ton

Type 1 A 
Washed

Type 1 B 
Unwashed Type 2

George's Creek Oakland 75 $10.75 No Bid No Bid $11.00 $21.75 No Bid No Bid
Accident 64 $10.75 No Bid No Bid $9.38 $20.13 No Bid No Bid

Grantsville 30 $10.75 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $15.15 No Bid No Bid
Keystone Lime - Eichorn Oakland 53 $16.00 $15.00 No Bid $7.78 $23.78 $22.78 No Bid

Accident 15 $16.00 $15.00 No Bid $2.20 $18.20 $17.20 No Bid
Grantsville 16 $16.00 $15.00 No Bid $2.34 $18.34 $17.34 No Bid

Keystone Lime - Cranesville Oakland 38 No Bid $13.00 No Bid $5.57 No Bid $18.57 No Bid
Accident 30 No Bid $13.00 No Bid $4.40 No Bid $17.40 No Bid

Grantsville 50 No Bid $13.00 No Bid $7.33 No Bid $20.33 No Bid
Maryland Minerals Oakland 11 $15.00 $13.00 No Bid $1.61 $16.61 $14.61 No Bid

Accident 28 $15.00 $13.00 No Bid $4.10 $19.10 $17.10 No Bid
Grantsville 53 $15.00 $13.00 No Bid $7.77 $22.77 $20.77 No Bid

Fairfax Concrete - Oakland Oakland 11 No Bid $13.50 No Bid $161.00 No Bid $174.50 No Bid
Accident 54 No Bid $13.50 No Bid $7.92 No Bid $21.42 No Bid

Grantsville 96 No Bid $13.50 No Bid $14.08 No Bid $27.58 No Bid
Fairfax Concrete - Scherr, WV Oakland 37 No Bid $8.50 No Bid $5.43 No Bid $13.93 No Bid

Accident 60 No Bid $8.50 No Bid $8.80 No Bid $17.30 No Bid
Grantsville 80 No Bid $8.50 No Bid $11.73 No Bid $20.23 No Bid

Belmont Aggregates Oakland 143 No Bid No Bid $7.00 $20.97 No Bid No Bid $27.97
Accident 92 No Bid No Bid $7.00 $13.49 No Bid No Bid $20.49

Grantsville 113 No Bid No Bid $7.00 $16.57 No Bid No Bid $23.57

Bid Price Total


