

**Crushed Stone Aggregates  
Bid #21-0408CS Bid Tabulation**

<b>Section 1: Pick Up Material at Plant by Public Works - Roads Division</b>								
<b>Stone Size</b>	<b>Maryland Minerals</b>	<b>George's Creek Stone</b>	<b>Keystone Lime - Eichorn Quarry</b>	<b>Keystone Lime - Cranesville Quarry</b>	<b>Allegheny Aggregates Bedford Quarry</b>	<b>Allegheny Aggregates Short Gap Quarry</b>	<b>Fairfax Concrete Oakland Plant</b>	<b>Fairfax Concrete Scherr Plant</b>
#1 Stone	\$13.50	\$14.50	\$14.30	\$13.50	No Bid	\$17.90	No Bid	\$18.85
#2 Stone	\$13.50	\$14.50	\$14.30	\$13.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.10
#8 Washed	\$20.50	No Bid	\$21.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.50	No Bid	No Bid
#8 Unwashed	\$20.00	\$17.50	\$21.20	\$20.00	No Bid	\$17.90	\$22.60	\$17.10
#10 Stone	\$11.50	\$8.50	\$12.20	\$11.50	\$6.50	\$15.30	\$18.00	\$12.65
CR1 Stone	\$11.00	\$11.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.55	No Bid	\$12.65
CR6 Stone	\$11.00	\$11.00	\$11.65	\$11.00	No Bid	\$13.55	\$18.00	\$12.65
CRD Stone	\$9.50	\$6.00	\$11.65	\$8.50	\$6.50	\$10.35	No Bid	\$12.00
#57 Washed	\$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.50	\$22.60	\$17.10
#67 Washed	\$16.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.50	\$22.60	\$17.10
#4 Grizzly Mat'l	No Bid	\$14.50	No Bid	\$7.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.00
Rip Rap	\$14.00	\$14.50	\$14.85	\$14.00	\$19.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.45
<b>Section 2: Pick Up Material at Plant by Public Works - Utilities Division</b>								
#2 Stone	\$13.50	\$14.50	\$14.30	\$13.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.10
#8 Washed	\$20.50	No Bid	\$21.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.50	\$22.60	No Bid
#10 Stone	\$11.50	\$8.50	\$12.20	\$11.50	No Bid	\$15.30	\$18.00	\$12.65
CR6 Stone	\$11.00	\$11.00	\$11.65	\$11.00	No Bid	\$13.55	\$18.00	\$12.65
#57 Washed	\$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.50	\$22.60	\$17.10
<b>Section 3: Pick Up Material at Plant by Solid Waste &amp; Recycling</b>								
#1 Stone	\$13.50	\$14.50	\$14.30	\$13.50	No Bid	\$17.90	No Bid	\$17.10
#2 Stone	\$13.50	\$14.50	\$14.30	\$13.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.10
#8 Unwashed	\$20.00	\$17.50	\$21.20	\$20.00	No Bid	\$17.90	\$22.60	\$17.10
#10 Stone	\$11.50	\$8.50	\$12.20	\$11.50	No Bid	\$15.30	\$18.00	\$12.65
CR6 Stone	\$11.00	\$11.00	\$11.65	\$11.00	No Bid	\$13.55	\$18.00	\$12.65
#57 Washed	\$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.50	\$22.60	\$17.10
Rip Rap	\$14.00	\$14.50	\$14.85	\$14.00	\$19.50	No Bid	\$23.35	\$19.45
<b>Section 4: Delivered Material to Solid Waste &amp; Recycling</b>								
#1 Stone	\$21.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.95
#2 Stone	\$21.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.20
#8 Unwashed	\$27.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.20
#10 Stone	\$19.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.75
CR6 Stone	\$18.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.75
#57 Washed	\$23.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.20
Rip Rap	\$21.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.55

Notes: