

**Motor Oil and Grease
Bid #21-0520MO Bid Tabulation**

	Bruceton Petroleum Co.	Oakland Oil
5W-30 Motor Oil Brand Name	Compass/Mag 1	Naviguard Ultra Syn SAE
Gallon	6.00	6.81
55 Gallon Drum	381.76	537.63
Quart	2.70	2.71
10W-30 Motor Oil Brand Name	Mag 1	Naviguard Premi Plus C14
Quart	2.70	158.40 (case 3 gal)
15W-40 Motor Oil Brand Name	Compass/Mag 1	Naviguard Prem Plus 15W-40
Gallon	7.64	8.46
55 Gallon Drum	478.14	506.63
5 Gallon Pail	47.89	54.63
Quart	3.60	N/A
85W-140 Gear Lubricant Brand Name	Compass	Naviguard 85W-140 GL5
Gallon	9.59	17.58
55 Gallon Drum	540.29	1010.19
5 Gallon Pail	62.38	93.89
120 LB. Keg	201.91	319.93
Multipurpose Tractor Fluid Brand Name	Compass	Naviguard Tractor Hyd Fluid
Gallon	6.24	7.65
55 Gallon Drum	379.58	461.73
5 Gallon Pail	41.13	49.68
Quart	No Bid	N/A
Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 Heavy Duty Engine Oil Brand Name	Shell Rotella 15W40T3	Mobil Delvac HDEO
Gallon	10.93	9.07
55 Gallon Drum	739.05	540.16
5 Gallon Pail	81.19	54.58
Quart	5.06	NA
Transmission Fluid Brand Name	Cam 2	Mobil Delvac 1 Transmission
Gallon	No Bid	N/A
55 Gallon Drum	489.00	610.24
5 Gallon Pail	44.80	212.52

	Bruceton Petroleum Co.	Oakland Oil
Quart	No Bid	4.38
Multipurpose Lithium Complex Grease Brand Name	Texas Red	Naviguard High Temp Ep2 Grease
Gallon	No Bid	N/A
55 Gallon Drum	925.05	1158.10
120 LB. Keg	283.18	351.15
Tube	2.55	624.00
10W-40 Motor Oil Brand Name	Mag 1	Peak PCMO SAE 10W 40 SN
Gallon	No Bid	N/A
55 Gallon Drum	No Bid	N/A
5 Gallon Pail	No Bid	78.97
Quart	2.70	20.14 (case 1.5 gal)
80W-90 High Performance Gear Oil Brand Name	Compass/Mag 1	Naviguard GL5 V#423020
Gallon	8.86	10.26
55 Gallon Drum	535.49	605.49
120 LB. Keg	179.98	61.95 (5 gal pail)
Tube	No Bid	N/A
Bottle (32 oz.)	4.11	N/A
Power Steering Fluid Brand Name	Pyroil	Pyroil
Gallon Bottle	No Bid	2.70
Quart	2.88 (12/1)	N/A
5W-20 Synthetic Blend GF-5 Motor Oil Brand Name	Compass/Mag 1	Mobil Special 5W-20
Gallon	6.00	6.81
55 Gallon Drum	370.59	447.18
120 LB. Keg	No Bid	N/A
5 Gallon Pail	No Bid	N/A
1 Gallon Pail	No Bid	N/A
Quart	2.70	2.71
5W-30 Synthetic Blend GF-5 Motor Oil Brand Name	Compass/Mag 1	Naviguard Elite SB GF6A/SP
Gallon	6.00	6.51
55 Gallon Drum	370.59	403.54
120 LB. Keg	No Bid	N/A
5 Gallon Pail	No Bid	N/A
1 Gallon Pail	No Bid	N/A
Quart	2.70	2.71
80W-140 Synthetic Gear Brand Name	Compass	Naviguard SYN GL-5

	Bruceton Petroleum Co.	Oakland Oil
Gallon	No Bid	19.52 (275 Gal Tote)
55 Gallon Drum	1068.35	N/A
5 Gallon Pail	115.13	N/A
120 LB. Keg	349.49	513.14
CD-50 Synthetic Gear Brand Name	Compass	Naviguard Ultra SYN Trans 50
Gallon	No Bid	N/A
55 Gallon Drum	988.32	1193.00
5 Gallon Pail	104.43	N/A
120 LB. Keg	328.47	553.52
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) Brand Name	Musket	Blue DEF
Gallon (various sized totes)	1.75	1.90
250 Gallon Tote	598.82	2.25
5 Gallon Bottle	No Bid	20.53
1 Gallon Bottle	No Bid	N/A